Total # of RAW Vendor Case Vendor
CASES POUNDS SCHOOL VENDOR . LESS NOI FFS AWARDED
Servings Needed for | PERCASE | DisTRICT | catatoc# |P°® Pefer®| noivarue | ToTaL cosT FFS TOTALCOST | VENDOR
End Product Code | per case Description SY 23-24 (POUNDS) Nol COST/CS
VENDORS: Please enter either vendor case price before NOI or vendor FFS cost/case only.
Bid pricing for commodity NOI Note bid quotes are before commaodity discounts are given Beacon City School District
Tyson Foods, Inc. (NOI Purchasing) Distributors Bid
P10000037831 92-113  |Fully Cooked Whole Grain Breaded Chicken Drumsticks 100 23.72 BEACON 39510 103.09 33.44] s 69.65 THURSTON
10703020928 132 FC WG Breaded Crispy MWWM Chicken Filets, 3.750z 110 33.74 BEACON 35572 118.11 47.57] $ 70.54 THURSTON
Pilgrim (NOI Purchasing) Distributors Bid
7572 110 WG Breaded Breast Chicken Tenders 160 32.14 BEACON 101.75 45.31] S 56.44 THURSTON
110458 104 CN WHLGRN BRD DRK MT PCORN SMCKR 6/5# FC 115 31.17 BEACON 39459 84.32 36.23] S 48.09 THURSTON
Nardone Bakery (NOI Purchasing) Distributors Bid
16WRSRMP1 64 16 inch self rising whole pizza WW Pepperoni 350 8 BEACON 16WRSRMP1 $67.46 55.58| $ 11.88 NARDONE BROS
16WRSRM1 8 16 inch self rising whole pizza WW Cheese 350 8 BEACON 16WRSRM1 $67.62 51.57] $ 16.05 NARDONE BROS
64WPS2 60 PIZZERIA STYLE 60 PC 75 8 BEACON 64WPS2 $63.42 47.37] S 16.05 NARDONE BROS
72WWSCM2 70 Wedge STUFFED CRUST 70 PC 150 8.75 BEACON 72WWSCM2 $58.23 40.67| $ 17.56 NARDONE BROS
S5WRMNY2 60 5" Round 75 7.5 BEACON SWRMNY2 $58.13 43.08] S 15.05 NARDONE BROS
S5WRMNY2 60 5" Round Pepperoni 75 75 BEACON SWRMP1NY2 $58.02 4598| s 12.04 NARDONE BROS
Schwans Food Service (NOI Purchasing) Distributors Bid
78637 | 72 [BIG DADDY'S® Primo 16" 51% WG Four Cheese Pizza 300 9 BEACON 403886| 84.81| 21.17] $ 63.64 ACE ENDICO
JTM Food Group (NOI Purchasing) Distributors Bid
PCP5734 263 *New* Target 2 Sodium Cheddar Cheese Sauce 45 15 BEACON 96.29 31.56] $ 64.73 THURSTON
PCP5741 262 *New* Target 2 Sodium Alfredo Sauce 30 8.11 BEACON 20469 89.20 17.06| $ 72.14 THURSTON
Maidrite Specialty Foods Inc. (NOI Purchasing) Distributors Bid
P75156-93322 | 192 [2.5 0z Fully Cooked Beef Pattie CB 5 4531  |BEACON NO BID NO BID NO BID |NO BID NO BID
International Food Solutions, Inc. (NOI Purchasing) Distributors Bid
72003 176  |Asian Food Solutions WG General Tso's Chicken 25 3465 |BEACON NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
73001 240  |Asian Food Solutions Gluten Free Teriyaki Chicken 30 4598 |BEACON NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
EES 2024-2025: Fee for Service Items Must Be Bid Directly With the Manufacturer ; NOT THE DISTRIBUTOR. —
encor AWARDED
FEE FOR SERVICE: JTM Food Group Usage “s"’:’::epe' District Cﬁ;‘\f_’gg . COFSFTSICS o1 :inST VENDOR
PCP5734 263  |*New* Target 2 Sodium Cheddar Cheese Sauce 45 15 BEACON 5734 53.54 2409.3[JTM
5715 525  [Cheddar Cheese Sauce 8.1 BEACON 5715 54.63 2458.35[JTM
5722 262 |Alfredo Sauce 8.11 BEACON 5722 56.84 1705.2|JTM
PCP5741 262  |*New* Target 2 Sodium Alfredo Sauce 30 8.1 BEACON 5741 60.85 1825.5)JT™M
FEE FOR SERVICE: Maidrite Specialty Foods Inc.
P75156-93322 | 192 [2.5 0z Fully Cooked Beef Pattie CB 5 4531  |BEACON NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID _ |NOBID




Vendor
T‘:;:IS:SOf P:ll:l\l‘\?ll)s SCHOOL VENDOR Case LESS NOI Vendor FES AWARDED
S Needed for | PER CASE DISTRICT CATALOG # price el AL A UL VENDOR
ervings before VALUE COST COST/CS COSsT
End Product Code | per case Description Sz || O, NOI
VENDORS: Please enter either vendor case price before NOI or vendor FFS cost/case only.
NOI - PAWLING CSD NOTE: ***MUST BE AVAILABLE FOR NOI PURCHASING/NO SUBS***
Tasty Brands (NOI Purchasing) Distributors Bid
P62001 | 144 |nutrition food based meal pattern equivalency: Each 2.00 oz. Whole Grain 100 7.2 PAWLING 360449 74.16 15.15] § 59.01 ACE ENDICO
Michael's Foods (NOI Purchasing) Distributors Bid
46025-75012-00 | 255 |T0ast Sticks, CN, 85/2.9 oz. Offer a healthy high protein and fiber menu option 200 4.93 PAWLING 2799 49.25 347)$ 4578 GINSBERGS
McCain's (NOI Purchasing) Distributors Bid
MCF05074 50 |'”'“VWTWM TS TR e O, e TozeT 25 2941 PAWLING 98038 37.79 s 3179 THURSTON
MCF04965 80 : MR ;““‘ ey e A TR 50 29.41 PAWLING TBD 3263 580]$ 2683 ACE ENDICO
OIF00215A 160 i : ’ Y PRSI 25 54,55 PAWLING 32380 51.55 8.56]§ 4299 THURSTON
MCX04717 160 25 54.55 PAWLING 50674 4145 8.56] $ 32.89 GINSBERGS
MCL03623 144 50 49.09 PAWLING 32041 44.42 7.70] $ 36.72 THURSTON
MCL03622 128 - , . 50 43.64 PAWLING 390079 47.30 6.85] § 40.45 ACE ENDICO
1000006639 128 oo ) e L L b 12 36.21 PAWLING 389791 60.21 568[$ 5453 ACE ENDICO
1000007470 160 f;”nj‘ﬂmWWMW° L 25 54.55 PAWLING 32131 53.44 856] § 4488 THURSTON
1000002789 186 o o 25 54.55 PAWLING 51,51 8.56]$ 4295 THURSTON
Red Gold (NOI Purchasing) Distributors Bid
REDSC99 412 blend of tomatoes with traditional Hispanic spices. The mild heat from the 10 59 PAWLING 651325 43.66 5.59] $ 38.07 ACE ENDICO
REDYL99 1140  |Tomato Ketchup made with Sugar is also Low Sodium (50mg/17g versus 10 10.39 PAWLING 5109 39.52 985§ 2967 THURSTON
REDYL9G 1000 packets Naturally Balanced Tomato Ketchup made with Sugar is also Low 40 4.81 PAWLING 951328 28.17 4.56] $ 23.61 ACE ENDICO
PRPKDX99 573 ripened tomatoes are crushed and screened to remove large tomato pieces, 37 17.41 PAWLING TBD 39.34 16.50)§  22.84 ACE ENDICO
Tyson Foods, Inc. (NOI Purchasing) Distributors Bid
10703000928 103 |WG Breaded Golden Crispy Whole Muscle Chicken Breast Filets, 4.0 oz. 40 30.95W PAWLING 326315 148.35 4364 |§ 10471 ACE ENDICO
P10703040928 175 Lv:i\lstﬁgir;f;ﬁed Golden Crispy Patties, Made from chickens raised with 10 9.76 WD 9.01 PAWLING 92678 9037 26.46 $ 6391 GINSBERGS
Tyson® Fully Cooked Whole Grain Breaded Chicken Nuggets, CN, 0.66 701W
10021550928 137 oiMade witr): No Artificial Colors or Flavors & No Preser\?agtives 190 6.47D PAWLING 92633 7595 19.00 § %% GINSBERGS
P10460120928 70 All Natural** Low Sodium Diced Chicken, 2.3 oz. Made from chickens raised 24 14.22 PAWLING 100152 47.23 20.06 $ 27117 THURSTON
P10703020928 132 Whole Grain Breaded Golden Crispy MWWM Chicken Filets, 3.75 oz. One 3.75| 80 33.74 PAWLING 35572 120.76 47.57 $ 7319 THURSTON
P10346960928 71-88  |Oven Roasted Glazed Chicken Wings Fully cooked and ready to cook from 12 26.39 PAWLING 101835 142.29 37.21 $ 105.08 THURSTON
P10703620928 121 Whole Grain Breaded Golden Crispy MWWM Boneless Chicken Wings, 0.79 25 32.74 PAWLING 35572 114.81 46.16 $ 6865 THURSTON
10174430928 336 Chicken Sausage Patty, Consistent piece sizes for easy CN portioning and 4 447D PAWLING NO BID NO BID NO BID #VALUE! NO BID
10000052436 89 Tyson® Fully Cooked Unbreaded Chicken Drumsticks With BBQ Sauce 10 21.58D PAWLING NO BID NO BID NO BID #VALUE! NO BID
P16660100928 72-113  |Whole Grain Breaded Traditional Chicken Drumsticks. Made from chickens 99 23.72D PAWLING 35545 112.15 $ 11215 GINSBERGS
Nardone Brothers (NOI Purchasing) - Distributors Bid
P96WW2 4x6 96  |PIZZA, 4X6, WHOLE GRAIN CRUST, 96ct case, One 5.000z. 4x6 Whole 130 12 PAWLING | P36WW2 4X6 $62.69 3861 |$ 2408 Nardone Bros
625WTME2 60 PIZZA, 6" whole grain crust, meat toppings, 60 ct case, One 5.570z. 6" Round 5 75 PAWLING 625WTME2 $62.16 5157 |$ 1059 Nardone Bros
P625WRM2 60 PIZZA, 6" whole grain crust, mozzarella cheese and sauce topped, 60 ct case, 5 75 PAWLING 625WRM2 $58.13 43.08 $ 1505 Nardone Bros
96WBPB2 96 Pizza, Bagel, 96 ct case, One 4.800z. Whole Wheat Cheese Pizza Bagel 5 12 PAWLING 96WBPB2 $67.94 43.86 $ 2408 Nardone Bros
64WPSBC 64 Pizza, Slice Buffalo Chicken, 64 servings/case, Each 4.600z. Serving of Whole 5 6 PAWLING 64WPSBC $70.62 58.58 $ 1204 Nardone Bros
60WUM2 60 Pizza, French Bread, 60ct case, One 5.500z. Whole Wheat French Bread 35 75 PAWLING 60WUM2 $58.13 43.08 $ 15.05 Nardone Bros
60WGUM2 60  |Pizza, WW GARLIC French Bread, 60ct case, One 4.500z. Whole Wheat 18 75 PAWLING 60WGUM2 $58.13 4308 |$ 1505 Nardone Bros
72WWSCM2 70 Pizza, Individual Slice, Stuffed Crust, 70 ct case, One 4.950z. Whole Wheat 45 8.75 PAWLING T2WWSCM2 $58.23 40.67 $ 1756 Nardone Bros
64WPS2 64 Pizza, NY Style Slice, Wedge, 64 ct case, Each 5.000z. Serving of Whole 60 8 PAWLING 64WPS2 $63.42 4737 |$  16.05 Nardone Bros
5WRMNY2 60 Pizza, Personal Pan 5", 60ct case, One 5.350z. 5" Round Whole Wheat 35 75 PAWLING 5WRMNY2 $58.13 4308 |$ 1505 Nardone Bros




ACE ENDICO

Missy Smith

80 INTERNATIONAL BLVD
BREWSTER, NY 10509
PHONE: 413-426-5433
FAX: 845-940-1517

Msmith@aceendico.com

GINSBERG'S

Charlie Winters

29 GINSBERG LN.
HUDSON, NY 12534
PHONE: 518-751-3250
FAX: 518-751-3250

bids@ginsbergsfoods.com ;
cwinters@ginsbergsfoods.com

JTM PROVISIONS CO., INC.
Brian Hofmeier

200 SALES DR.

HARRISON, OH 45030
PHONE: 800-626-2308

NO FAX
brianhofmeier@jtmfoodgroup.com

JTMK12bids@jtmfoodgroup.com

caroleerb@jtmfoodgroup.com

NARDONE BROS. BAKING CO, INC.
Vincent Nardone

420 NEW COMMERCE BLVD.
HANOVER TOWNSHIP, PA 18706
PHONE: 570-823-0141

FAX: 570-823-2581
vincent.nardone@nardonebros.com

THURSTON FOODS INC.

Tim Thurston

30 THURSTON DR.
WALLINGFORD, CT 06492
PHONE: 203-265-1525

FAX: 203-284-0712
tim.thurston@thurstonfoods.com
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