DUTCHESS BOCES COOPERATIVE FRESH BAKED BREAD BID #2223-04 BID ITEMS

TERM: JULY 7, 2022 - JUNE 30, 2023

NOTE: Bid Items 1-22 must be at least 51% Whole Grain. The remainder of PRIMARY AWARD SECONDARY AWARD
grains must be enriched. SLICED BREAD - DO NOT COUNT ENDS IN USABLE ROCKLAND BAKERY BIMBO BAKERIES USA INC
MEETS BUY MEETS BUY
BID DESCRIPTION - All Products Must Meet USDA AMERICAN VENDOR AMERICAN VENDOR
. . UNIT OF MEASURE PRICE PER UOM PRICE PER UOM
ITEM # Grain Requirements PROVISION (YES CATALOG # PROVISION (YES CATALOG #
OR NO) OR NO)
1 BAGELS, 51% WHOLE GRAIN WHEAT, MINI, NO BID NO BID
SLICED, 1.8 OZ/EA 12/PACK
5 BAGELS, 51% WHOLE GRAIN WHEAT, SLICED, VES 1462-02 491 NO BID
2.4 OZ/EA (HS/MS ONLY) 12/PACK
3 BAGELS, 51% WHOLE GRAIN WHEAT, SLICED, 4 VES 0173-02 497 NO BID
OZ/EA (HS ONLY) 12/PACK :
4 BREAD, STUB -100% WHOLE GRAIN WHEAT- LOAF - 22 Useable VES 0244-01 2.02 YES 6377 1.70
1 0Z/SLICE Slices/LOAF
5 BREAD, STUB - 51% WHOLE GRAIN WHEAT -1 LOAF - 26 Useable NO BID NO BID
0OZ/SLICE, 28 OZ LOAF Slices/LOAF
6 LOAF - 20 Useable YES 024301 2.02 YES 3239 1.94
BREAD, WHOLE GRAIN WHITE, 1 OZ/SLICE Slices/LOAF
BREAD, FRENCH BREAD, 51% WHOLE GRAIN, 14
7 07 LOAF LOAF NO BID NO BID
BREAD, FRENCH BREAD, 51% WHOLE WHEAT,
8 15 07 LOAF LOAE YES 1409-01 1.71 NO BID
BREAD, RYE, 51% WHOLE GRAIN, SEEDED, DELI
° STYLE, 19 OZ LOAF LOAF O WED et s
CLUB ROLL, 51% WHOLE WHEAT, SLICED, 4", 2.4
10 OZ/EA (HS/MS ONLY) 12/PACK RO MO
CLUB ROLL, 51% WHOLE WHEAT, SLICED, 6", 3
11 0Z/EA (HS ONLY) 12/PACK YES 1433-02 3.58 NO BID
12 PITA BREAD, 51% WHOLE GRAIN 12/PACK RO MO
13 ROLL, DINNER, 51% WHEAT, BREAKAWAY, 1.17 YES 3.67/16 PACK YES 5397 1.86/12 PACK
OZ/EA 12/PACK
14 ROLL, DINNER, 51% WHOLE GRAIN WHEAT, 1.5 VES 1462-01 3.67/16 PACK NO BID
OZ/EA 12/PACK
15 ROLL, HAMBURGER, 51% WHOLE GRAIN VES 1403-01 2.02 NO BID
WHEAT, SLICED, 2 OZ/EA 12/PACK
16 ROLL, HAMBURGER, 51% WHOLE WHEAT, NO BID YES 5392 302
SLICED, 2 OZ/EA 16/PACK '
17 ROLL, HOT DOG, 51% WHOLE GRAIN WHEAT, 2 VES 1402-01 2.02 NO BID
OZ/EA 12/PACK
18 ROLL, HOT DOG, 51% WHOLE WHEAT, 2 OZ/EA 16/PACK NO BID YES 2393 3.24
19 ROLL, KAISER, 51% WHOLE GRAIN WHEAT, NO BID NO BID
SLICED, 1.8 OZ/EA 12/PACK
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2 ROLL, KAISER, 51% WHOLE GRAIN, 4” DIAM, VES 1407-02 3.35 YES 3242 243
SLICED, 2 OZ/EA 12/PACK ’ ’
ROLL, KAISER, 51% WHOLE WHEAT, SLICED, 2.4
21 YES 1405-02 3.45 NO BID
0Z/EA (HS/MS ONLY) 12/PACK
ROLL, KAISER, 51% WHOLE WHEAT, SLICED, 4
22 0Z/EA (HS ONLY) 12/PACK YES 1431-02 3.58 NO BID
23 YES 1412-01 3.35/12 PACK YES 6375 1.94/6 PACK
ROLL, SAUSAGE, 51% WHOLE GRAIN, 2 OZ/EA 6/PACK / /
THE FOLLOWING ITEMS ARE NOT WHOLE
GRAIN
24 BAGELS, 1.8 OZ, PLAIN, SLICED (NOT WG) 12/PACK NO BID NO BID
25 BAGELS, 1.8 OZ, SESAME, SLICED (NOT WG) 12/PACK NO BID NO BID
2% BAGELS, 2.4 OZ, CINNAMON RAISIN, SLICED NO BID NO BID
(NOT WG) 12/PACK
27 BAGELS, 2.4 OZ, PLAIN, SLICED (NOT WG) 12/PACK NO BID NO BID
28 BAGELS, 2.4 OZ, POPPY, SLICED (NOT WG) 12/PACK NO BID NO BID
29 BAGELS, 2.4 OZ, SESAME, SLICED (NOT WG) 12/PACK NO BID NO BID
BAGELS, 4 OZ, CINNAMON RAISIN, SLICED (NOT
30 WG) 12/PACK YES 0175-02 4.97 NO BID
31 BAGELS, 4 OZ, EVERYTHING, SLICED (NOT WG) 12/PACK YES 0172-02 4.97 NO BID
32 BAGELS, 4 OZ., MARBLE, SLICED (NOT WG) 12/PACK YES 0345-02 4.97 NO BID
33 BAGELS, 4 OZ, PLAIN, SLICED (NOT WG) 12/PACK YES 0165-02 4.97 NO BID
3 BAGELS, 4 OZ., PUMPERKNICKLE, SLICED (NOT NO BID NO BID
WG) 12/PACK
35 BAGELS, 4 OZ, SESAME, SLICED (NOT WG) 12/PACK YES 0167-02 4.97 NO BID
36 CLUB ROLL, 4" SOFT CRUST, SLICED (NOT WG) 12/PACK NO BID NO BID
37 CLUB ROLL, 6", SLICED (NOT WG) 12/PACK YES 0118-02 3.58 NO BID
38 HARD ROLLS, KAISER, 2.4 OZ, PLAIN (NOT WG) 12/PACK YES 0249-01 345 NO BID
39 NO BID NO BID
HARD ROLLS, KAISER, 3.5 0Z, ONION (NOT WG) 12/PACK
40 HARD ROLLS, KAISER, 3.5 OZ, PLAIN (NOT WG) 12/PACK YES 0402-01 3.58 NO BID
41 |HARD ROLLS, KAISER, 3.5 0Z, SESAME (NOT WG) 12/PACK RO MO
Rockland Bakery Inc. Bimbo Bakeries USA, Inc.
94 Demarest Mill Road, Nanuet, NY 10954 428 Westridge Pkwy., McDonough, GA 30253
Phone: 845-623-5800 Phone: 404-623-8975
Contact: Domenica Battaglia Contact: Angela Bell
Email: dbattaglia@rocklandbakery.com Email: angela.bell@grupobimbo.com
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