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May 1, 2024 BOARD OF EDUCATION

MEMO

TO: Jodi Delucia, Ph.D., Deputy Superintendent

FROM: Matthew Metzger, School Business Ofﬁd@

RE: Cooperative Fresh Baked Bread and Bread Products Bid #2425-02

I recommend the acceptance of the bid offer from Rockland Bakery, Inc. as the low bidder for our Cooperative
Fresh Baked Bread and Bread Products Bid. I also recommend a secondary award to Bimbo Bakeries USA, Inc.,
primarily for the items that Rockland Bakery did not bid on but also as an alternate if the supply shortages that
we are currently experiencing with all commodities continue. Please note that Bimbo Bakeries USA, Inc. bid is
only for the following school districts: DC BOCES, Pine Plains CSD, Poughkeepsie City SD, and Spackenkill
UFSD.

The contract period is from July 1, 2024, through June 30, 2025, with the option of up to three twelve (12)
month extensions upon mutual consent.
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DUTCHESS BOCES COOPERATIVE FRESH BAKED BREAD BID #2425-02
BID ITEMS - TERM: JULY 1, 2024 THROUGH JUNE 30, 2025

NOTE: Bid [tems 1-18 must be at least 51% Whole Grain. The remainder of

VENDOR NAME: VENDOR NAME:
ains must be enriched. SLICED BREAD - DO NOT COUNT ENDS IN USABLE 4 {
o e Rockland Bakery, Inc. Bimbo Bakeries USA, Inc.
) *Bimbo will only provide to: DC Boces, Pine Plains CSD,
Poughkeepsie City SD, Spackenkill UFSD
;f;;‘;f::'} MEETS BUY ME:SN:JLE:ID MEETS BUY UNIT OF
BIDITEM| o kcrep | DESCRIPTION - All Products Must UNIT OF MEASURE AMERICAN & DIFFERENT' VENDOR bRl PER LGRS AMERICAN | MEASURE BID, IF VENDOR BnlcE pen it
# Meet USDA Grain Requirements (uom) PROVISION (YES CATALOG # PROVISION (YES |DIFFERENT FROM| CATALOG #
e OR NO) POOM 8% OR NO) BID SPEC
2025 SPEC x
BAGELS, 51% WHOLE GRAIN WHEAT,
; ; i
2 M MINI, SLICED, 1.8 OZ/EA 12/PACK NOBID NO BID NO BID
BAGELS, 51% WHOLE GRAIN WHEAT,
" ’ 62-02 .32
: 638 1S1ICED, 2.4 0Z/EA (HS/MS ONLY) 12/PACK pLs 1462-0 53 NO BID
BAGELS, 51% WHOLE GRAIN WHEAT,
3 277 ' : YES 0173-02 5.40 NO BID
SLICED, 4 OZ/EA (HS ONLY) 12/PACK
BREAD, CRACKED WHEAT, 1.3 oz LOAF - 16 Useable
4 NEW . J : YES NO BID NO BID NO BID
SLICE, MIN. 51% WHOLE GRAIN Slices/LOAF
5 NEW BREAD, HEARTY FLAXSEED, 1.3 0Z LOAF - 16 Useable YES NO BID NO BID NO BID
SLICE, MIN. 51% WHOLE GRAIN Slices/LOAF
LOAF - 16 Useabl
6 new | BREAD: OAT BRAN, 1.3 OZ SLICE, i YES NO BID NO BID NO BID
MIN, 51% WHOLE GRAIN Slices/LOAF
BREAD, STUB -100% WHOLE GRAIN
7 4994  |WHEAT- 10Z/SLICE CREDITING 10Z | LOAF-22 Useable NO BID NO BID YES 6377 2.55
GR EQ/SLICE Slices/LOAF
BREAD, WHOLE GRAIN WHITE, 1
! g . 26 USABLE 0244-01 3 ;
8 4808 | 07/SLICE CREDITING 1oz GR EQ/sLICE |  LOAF -20 Useable e 40 230 YES 3239 250
Slices/LOAF
BREAD, FRENCH BREAD, 51% WHOLE
9 178 : : YES 1409-01 1.85 NO BID
WHEAT, 15 OZ LOAF LOAF
CLUB ROLL, 51% WHOLE WHEAT,
; ; YES 1410-02 3.76 N
10 02 SLICED, 4", 2.4 OZ/EA (HS/MS ONLY) 12/PACK e
11 988 CLUBROLL, 5145 WHOLEWHEAT, YES 1433-02 3.88 YES 6t - 202 6375 2.10
SLICED, 6", 3 OZ/EA (HS ONLY) 12/PACK
Q
i New | ROLL DINNER, MIN. 51% CRACKED ORI N i NGl
WHEAT, 1.8 OZ/EA. 10/PACK
ROLL, DINNER, 51% WHEAT,
J ; ¢ NO BID NO BID ;
13 120 Sl AT bige 12/PACK 0 0Bl YES 12ct 5397 2.16
14 dgdg (|BOLLDINNER, S1eWHOLEGRAIN YES 16 PK 1460-01 3.97 NO BID
WHEAT, 1.5 0Z/EA 12/PACK
ROLL, HAMBURGER, 51% WHOLE 100% Whole
15 12,746 |GRAIN WHEAT, SLICED, 2.15 OZ/EA YES 1485-01 2.20 YES Wheat - 5392 4,08
CREDITING 2.00 0Z GR EQ/SLICE 2.190z ea 2gr eq
12/PACK
ROLL, HAMBURGER, 51% WHOLE
. i NO BI
16 779 ih AT, SLiCER: 2.02/EA NO BID 0 BID NO BID
16/PACK
ROLL, HOT DOG, 51% WHOLE GRAIN 100% Whole
17 1900  |WHEAT, 2.15 OZ/EA CREDITING 2.00 YES 1486-01 2.20 YES Wheat - 5393 4.08
0Z GR EQ/SLICE 2.190z ea 2gr eq
12/PACK




DUTCHESS BOCES COOPERATIVE FRESH BAKED BREAD BID #2425-02
BID ITEMS - TERM: JULY 1, 2024 THROUGH JUNE 30, 2025

;:::r:lt::l.r MEETS BUY ME::LTR(:;D MEETS BUY UNIT OF
BID ITEM DESCRIPTION - All Products Must AMERICAN ! VENDOR AMERICAN | MEASUREBID, IF|  VENDOR
PRICE PER UOM PRICE PER UOM
# PROIECTED | ¢ USDA Grain Requirements | UTT OF MEASURE | o ovision (ves | ' D'FFERENT | yraio6 s PROVISION (YES |DIFFERENTFROM| CATALOG #
USAGE 2024- FROM BID
OR NO) OR NO) BID SPEC.
2025 SPEC.
0
- . ROLL, HOT DOG, 51% WHOLE WHEAT, A s Kool
2 0Z/EA
16/PACK
19 1850  [ROLL KAISER, 51% WHOLE GRAIN YES 1407-02 3.64 NO BID
WHEAT, SLICED, 1.8 OZ/EA 12/PACK
ROLL, KAISER, 51% WHOLE GRAIN, 4" 14002 (2,3 01
20 304 ; L ' YES each) See Item 22 3. 3242 3.12
DIAM, SLICED, 2 0Z/EA
12/PACK below.
ROLL, KAISER, 51% WHOLE WHEAT,
21 2674 : 2 ' YES 1405-02 3,72 NO BID
SLICED, 2.4 OZ/EA (HS/MS ONLY) 12/PACK !
ROLL, KAISER, 51% WHOLE WHEAT,
22 154 |SLICED, 3.5 OZ/EA (HS ONLY); YES 1431.02 3.88 NO BID
CREDITING AS 3.00 0Z GR EQ/EA 12/PACK
THE FOLLOWING ITEMS ARE NOT
WHOLE GRAIN
23 0 Bagel Sticks 144/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID
BAGELS, 4 0Z, ASSORTED, SLICED
e d ’ YES 0125-01 #N/A
> 3 inoTwe) 12/PACK / NO BID
BAGELS, 2.4 0Z, CINNAMON RAISIN,
25 0 ; ] g NO BID NO BID
SLICED (NOT WG) 12/PACK NO BID
BAGELS, 2.4 0Z, PLAIN, SLICED (NOT
26 182 e — YES 0342-02 HN/A NO BID
BAGELS, 2.4 OZ, POPPY, SLICED (NOT
27 0 Vis, TRl NO BID NO BID NO BID
BAGELS, 2.4 OZ, SESAME, SLICED
28 0 y / ¢ NO BID NO BID
(NOT WG) 12/PACK NO BID
BAGELS, 4 OZ, CINNAMON RAISIN
b ! YES 2 ;
29 B8 e (NGTWE) — 0175-0 5.40 NO BID
BAGELS, 4 OZ, EVERYTHING, SLICED
' ! ! YES - i
30 W |iorwe SEAR 0172-02 5.40 NO BID
BAGELS, 4 OZ., MARBLE, SLICED (NOT
31 6 st 12/PACK YES 0345-02 5.40 NO BID
BAGELS, 4 OZ, PLAIN, SLICED (NOT
32 215 | e ASTRER YES 0165-02 5.40 NO BID
BAGELS, 4 0Z, SESAME, SLICED (NOT
YES 0167-02 i
33 264 |ve) TR 5.40 NO BID




DUTCHESS BOCES COOPERATIVE FRESH BAKED BREAD BID #2425-02
BID ITEMS - TERM: JULY 1, 2024 THROUGH JUNE 30, 2025

;fs:i% MEETS BUY MEg:'&g: s MEETS BUY UNIT OF
BIDITEM| o kctep | PESCRIPTION - All Products Must UNIT OF MEASURE AMERICAN i DIFFERENT‘ VENDOR ORICE TR Lo AMERICAN | MEASURE BID, IF VENDOR GHCEpER Lioha
# | saGE 2024.| ™Meet USDA Grain Requirements (uoMm) PROVISION (YVES | "o "o CATALOG # PROVISION (YES |DIFFERENT FROM| CATALOG #
o OR NO) e OR NO) BID SPEC.
THE FOLLOWING ITEMS ARE NOT
WHOLE GRAIN

a5 5 CLUB ROLL, 4" SOFT CRUST, SLICED N Hasib

(NOTWG) 12/PACK NO BID
36 0 CLUB ROLL, 6", SLICED (NOT WG) 12/PACK NO BID NO BID
3 3 HARD ROLLS, KAISER, 3.5 OZ, ONION R e

(NOT WG) 12/PACK

HARD ROLLS, KAISER, 3.5 OZ, PLAIN
38 808 (NOT W) 12/PACK YES 0402-02 3.88
39 48 MINI DANISH EA YES 0499-01 10.84
40 1902 DANISH ASSORTED EA YES 0844-01 16.22
41 34 MUFFINS, MINI ASSORTED 12/PACK YES 0490-01 10.20
42 180 MUFFINS, LARGE ASSORTED 12/PACK YES 0844-01 16.22
43 14 DONUTS, LARGE ASSORTED 12/PACK YES 0593-01 10.32
44 0 PASTRY, LARGE ASSORTED 12/PACK NO BID NO BID

Bimbo Bakeries USA, Inc. 428 Westridge Pkwy. McDonough, GA 30253 PHONE: 404-623-8975

Angela Bell angela.bell@grupobimbo.com

Rockland Bakery Inc. 94 Demarest Mill Rd. ~ Nanuet, NY 10954 PHONE: 845-623-5800

Domenica Battaglia

dbattaglia@rocklandbakery.com




