

16.06

DUTCHESS BOCES

INNOVATION | PARTNERSHIP | GROWTH

Jodi DeLucia, Ph.D.
District Superintendent

Michael Skerritt
Assistant Superintendent for Business & Operations
845.486.4800 Ext. 2227 | michael.skerritt@dcbooces.org

TO: Jodi DeLucia, Ph.D., District Superintendent
FROM: Michael Skerritt, Assistant Superintendent for Business & Operations
DATE: June 24, 2026
RE: Cooperative Photocopy Paper RFB #2627-08



I recommend to award the bid offers from **WB Mason** of Newburgh, NY, and **Quill LLC** of Lincolnshire, IL, for the **Cooperative Photocopy Paper RFB #2627-08** as the responsible proposers whose submission was determined to be the most advantageous to Dutchess BOCES based on the established evaluation criteria.

The contract period is from October 24, 2026 through October 23, 2027 with the option to extend for four (4) additional one-year terms.

MS/tl
Attachment



Dutchess BOCES, 5 BOCES Road, Poughkeepsie, NY 12601 | 845.486.4800 | www.dcbooces.org

Participating districts: Arlington | Beacon | Dover | Hyde Park | Millbrook | Pawling | Pine Plains | Poughkeepsie | Red Hook | Rhinebeck | Spackenkill | Wappingers | Webutuck

An Equal Opportunity/Affirmative Action Employer

AWARD SHEET
DUTCHESS BOCES COOP. PHOTOCOPY PAPER RFB #2627-08
TERM: OCTOBER 24, 2026 THROUGH OCTOBER 23, 2027

ITEM #	*EST. # OF UNITS	DESCRIPTION	BRAND BID	CATALOG #	PRICE PER REAM (500 SHEETS)	PRICE PER CARTON (10 REAMS)	PRICE PER PALLET (40 CARTONS)	PRICE PER TRUCKLOAD (840 CARTONS)	Awarded Vendor
STANDARD PAPER									
1	110 CTNS.	BRIGHTS - 20 LB. 8-1/2" X 11" WAUSAU ASTROBRIGHTS - ASSORTED COLORS	Astrobrights	WALL267XX	\$14.88	\$112.00	\$4,320.00	No Bid	WB Mason
2	10 CTNS.	BRIGHTS - 24 LB. 8-1/2" X 11" WAUSAU ASTROBRIGHTS - ASSORTED COLORS	Astrobrights	WALL2XXX	\$13.62	\$112.00	\$4,320.00	No Bid	WB Mason
3	1375 CTNS.	COPY PAPER - 20 LB. 8-1/2" X 11" - BRIGHTNESS: WHITE, 97 (US); 110 (INT'L)	Mason	WBM97200	\$4.88	\$32.32	\$1,244.40	\$24,385.20	WB Mason
4	355 CTNS.	COPY PAPER - 20 LB. 8-1/2" X 11" - ASSORTED COLORS	Mason	WMB2201XX	\$5.88	\$52.30	\$2,052.00	No Bid	WB Mason
5	0 CTNS.	COPY PAPER - 20 LB. 8-1/2" X 11" - 3 HOLE PUNCHED	Mason	WBM99230	\$5.33	\$38.80	\$1,472.00	No Bid	WB Mason
6	30 CTNS.	COPY PAPER - 20 LB. 8-1/2" X 14" (LEGAL) - WHITE	Mason	WBM97214	\$6.88	\$47.80	\$1,872.00	No Bid	WB Mason
7	40 CTNS.	COPY PAPER - 20 LB. 8-1/2" X 14" (LEGAL) - ASSORTED COLORS	Hammermill	HMM103XXX	\$9.97	\$83.70	\$3,218.80	No Bid	WB Mason
8	0 CTNS.	COPY PAPER - 20 LB. 11" X 17" - WHITE	Mason	WBM97217	\$10.66	\$38.80	\$1,472.00	No Bid	WB Mason
9	0 CTNS.	COVER STOCK - 67 LB. 8-1/2" X 11" - WHITE (250/REAM)	Springhill	SPAL016000	\$6.97	\$66.90	\$2,676.00	No Bid	WB Mason
10	0 REAMS	COVER STOCK - 67 LB. 8-1/2" X 11" - ASSORTED COLORS (250/REAM)	Domtar	DMR943XX	\$7.97	\$72.90	\$2,916.00	No Bid	WB Mason
11	2 REAMS	CARD STOCK - 90 LB. 8-1/2" X 11" - WHITE (250/REAM)	Springhill	SPHL015101	\$9.79	\$77.90	\$3,116.00	No Bid	WB Mason
12	0 REAMS	CARD STOCK - 90 LB. 8-1/2" X 11" - ASSORTED COLORS (250/REAM)	Domtar	DMR942XX	\$10.33	\$84.20	\$3,368.00	No Bid	WB Mason
RECYCLED PAPER									
13	0 CTNS	RECYCLED WHITE BOND MULTIPURPOSE COPY PAPER, 20 LB, 8 1/2" X 11" , 100% POST CONSUMER FIBER	Staples	Ream 620016STP Case 620014	\$11.00	\$76.55	No Bid	No Bid	Quill
14	0 CTNS	RECYCLED WHITE BOND MULTIPURPOSE COPY PAPER, 20 LB, 8 1/2" X 11" , 30% POST CONSUMER FIBER	Staples	Ream 492071STP Case 492072	\$6.57	\$62.19	No Bid	No Bid	Quill
15	0 CTNS	RECYCLED WHITE BOND MULTIPURPOSE COPY PAPER, 20 LB, 8 1/2" X 14" , 100% POST CONSUMER FIBER	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
16	0 CTNS	RECYCLED WHITE BOND MULTIPURPOSE COPY PAPER, 20 LB, 8 1/2" X 14" , 30% POST CONSUMER FIBER	Staples	Ream 580525STP Case 581760	\$11.25	\$97.69	No Bid	No Bid	Quill
17	0 CTNS	RECYCLED WHITE BOND MULTIPURPOSE COPY PAPER, 20 LB, 11" X 17" , 100% POST CONSUMER FIBER	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
18	0 CTNS	RECYCLED WHITE BOND MULTIPURPOSE COPY PAPER, 20 LB, 11" X 17" , 30% POST CONSUMER FIBER	Staples	Ream 580336STP Case 581761	\$15.80	\$57.52	No Bid	No Bid	Quill
19	0 CTNS	RECYCLED WHITE BOND MULTIPURPOSE COPY PAPER, 20 LB, 8 1/2" X 11" , 3 HOLE PUNCHED, 100% POST CONSUMER FIBER	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
20	0 CTNS	RECYCLED WHITE BOND MULTIPURPOSE COPY PAPER, 20 LB, 8 1/2" X 11" , 3 HOLE PUNCHED, 30% POST CONSUMER FIBER	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

VENDOR CONTACT INFORMATION	
W.B. MASON CO., INC.	
12 JEANNE DRIVE, NEWBURGH, NY 12550 CONTACT: RYAN DRISCOLL	
TELEPHONE: 888-926-2765 EMAIL: ryan.driscoll@wbmason.com	
QUILL LLC	
300 TRI STATE INTERNATIONAL DRIVE, SUITE 300, LINCOLNSHIRE, IL 60069	
CONTACT: SARAH SHERMAN	
TELEPHONE 800-634-4809 FAX: 800-789-2016 EMAL: bid@quill.com	