

Dutchess BOCES Cooperative Miscellaneous Auto Parts Bid #1516-13 Ext. #1
 Contract Period: January 1, 2017 - December 31, 2017 - THREE YEAR RENEWABLE CONTRACT

BID AWARD SHEET

	Manufacturer:	Percent Discount from Jobber List
Air Conditioning Products		
NOTE: This group shall include, but not be limited to the following: condensers, compressors, blower motors, switches, dryers and valves.	Everco	NO BID
	Four Seasons	51.00%
Auto Body Repair Supplies		
NOTE: This group shall include, but not be limited to the following: body filler, paint, paint equipment, sandpaper and tape.		42.00%
Automatic Transmission Filter Kits		
	ATP	48.00%
	NAPA	48.00%
Bearings (Ball & Roller)		
	Federal Mogul (Brower/BCA)	NO BID
	SKF (McQuay-Norris)	53.50%
	Timken	NO BID
Belts & Hoses		
NOTE: This group shall include, but not be limited to the following items: automotive belts, radiator hoses, heater hoses, air brake hoses & fuel lines.	Dyaco	NO BID
	Gates WeatherHead (Air Brake)	51-63%
Brake Shoes & Pads		
	Bendix	NO BID
	Centric	NO BID
	NAPA - Severe Duty	54.00%
	Raybestos	NO BID
	Wagner	NO BID
Chassis Parts		
NOTE: This group shall include, but not be limited to the following: ball joints, tie rod ends, springs & torsion bars.	Dana	53.00%
	Moog	NO BID
	SKF (McQuay-Norris)	NO BID
	TRW	NO BID

Dutchess BOCES Cooperative Miscellaneous Auto Parts Bid #1516-13 Ext. #1
 Contract Period: January 1, 2017 - December 31, 2017 - THREE YEAR RENEWABLE CONTRACT

BID AWARD SHEET

	Manufacturer:	Percent Discount from Jobber List
Chemicals	SPECIFY MANUFACTURER	
NOTE: This group shall include, but not be limited to the following: brake cleaner, carburetor cleaner, oil and WD-40	CRC Brake Cleaner	75.50%
	Mac Carburetor	43.00%
	Castrol Oil	71.00%
	WD-40	55.00%
Clutch Discs & Assemblies (NEW)		
	NAPA New Luk	54.00%
	Westling	NO BID
Cooling & Heating System Products		
NOTE: This group shall include, but not be limited to the following: thermostats, heater cores, heater control valves, blower motors & fan controls.	Four Seasons	47-54%
	Dorman Noe	54.00%
	Spectra Premium	54.00%
	Stant	60.00%
Exhaust Parts & Mufflers		
NOTE: This group shall include, but not be limited to the following: mufflers, exhaust parts, tailpipes, hangers, clamps & hardware.	Bosal	NO BID
	Walker	52.00%
Filters		
NOTE: This group shall include, but not limited to the following: air filter, gas filters and oil filters.	Wix NAPA	44.00%
Fuel Pumps, Valves, Misc. Caps - OEM Equivalent		
Note from Vendor: Different types of products. Prices vary	AC	48 - 56%
	Carter	48 - 56%
	Delphi	55.50%
	Gates	48 - 56%
	Stant	48- 56%

Dutchess BOCES Cooperative Miscellaneous Auto Parts Bid #1516-13 Ext. #1
 Contract Period: January 1, 2017 - December 31, 2017 - THREE YEAR RENEWABLE CONTRACT

BID AWARD SHEET

	Manufacturer:	Percent Discount from Jobber List
Gaskets		
	Fel-Pro	51.00%
	McCord	NO BID
Ignition Equipment		
NOTE: This group shall include, but not be limited to the following: module rotors, contact sets, condensers, coils, vacuum controls, voltage regulators and switches & distributor caps.	BWD	NO BID
	Cole Hersee	NO BID
	Echlin	52.00%
	Motorcraft	NO BID
	Standard Motor	NO BID
Lighting Products		
NOTE: This group shall include bulbs, flashers, lights & lenses. Note from Vendor: Different type products. Prices vary	Dominion	51-66%
	Federal	51-66%
	Grote	51.00%
	Signal Stat	51-66%
	Truck Lite	51-66%
	Wagner	66.00%
Misc. Brake Parts (N1)		
NOTE: This group shall include , but not be limited to the following: brake drums, brake hose, brake spring kits, cylinder repair kits, disc brake hardware, master cyclinder, rotor, wheel cylinder & rebuilt calipers.	Bendix	52-57%
	Centric	52-57%
	Raybestos	52-57%
	United	57.00%
	Wagner	52-57%
Rebuilt Calipers Loaded (N2)	A-1	55.50%
Misc. Ignition & Battery Cables		
NOTE: This group shall include but not limited to the following items: battery cables, ignition cable sets & low tension cables.	Belden	56.00%
	BWD	NO BID
	Standard	NO BID

Dutchess BOCES Cooperative Miscellaneous Auto Parts Bid #1516-13 Ext. #1
 Contract Period: January 1, 2017 - December 31, 2017 - THREE YEAR RENEWABLE CONTRACT

BID AWARD SHEET

	Manufacturer:	Percent Discount from Jobber List
Seals		
	SKF	52.00%
	L & S	NO BID
	Victor	NO BID
Shock Absorbers		
	Monroe	51.00%
	Motorcraft	NO BID
Small Engine/Motorcycle Parts		
NOTE: This group shall include but not limited to the following items: gaskets, rebuild kits for carburetors and seals		44.00%
Spark Plugs		
	A/C	50.00%
	Autolite Platinum	52.00%
	Champion	48.00%
	NGK	53.00%
Starters & Alternators (Rebuilt)		
NOTE: This group shall include the following: alternators, DC generators & starters.	A&S Rebuilders	50.00%
	Delco	52.00%
	Superior	NO BID
Tools		
NOTE: This group shall include but not limited to the following items: hammers, pliers, screwdrivers, socket sets and wrenches. Vendor note: Refer to tool & equipment flyer	Hammers	52.00%
	Pliers	38.00%
	Screwdrivers	41.00%
	Socket Sets	48.00%
	Wrenches	59.00%

Dutchess BOCES Cooperative Miscellaneous Auto Parts Bid #1516-13 Ext. #1
 Contract Period: January 1, 2017 - December 31, 2017 - THREE YEAR RENEWABLE CONTRACT
BID AWARD SHEET

	Manufacturer:	Percent Discount from Jobber List
Universal Joints		
	Borg Warner	56.00%
	Neapso	56.00%
	Precision	56.00%
	TRW	56.00%
Water Pumps (NEW)		
	BWD	NO BID
	Dana Corp. (PC)	NO BID
	Ford	NO BID
	Gates	55.49%
	TRW	NO BID
Windshield Wipers & Arms		
	ANCO	NO BID
	NAPA - Premium	52.00%
	Trico	NO BID

VENDOR:

Jack Haverty's Auto Parts, Inc.

Contact: Ron Patterson
 1623 Main Street - PO Box 688
 Pleasant Valley, NY 12569
 Tel: 845-635-8818
 Fax: 845-635-8645
 Email: RonatNAPA@yahoo.com