DUTCHESS BOCES COOPERATIVE CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES BID #1617-11
CONTRACT PERIOD: January 1, 2017 through December 31, 2017

UNIT

BRAND NAME

ITEM # DESCRIPTION S D CATALOG # PRICE/UNIT VENDOR
1 A-BEN-AQUI - GRAFITTI REMOVER, SCOURING PASTE - 20 OZ. CAN -
NO SUBSTITUTIONS 6/CASE A-BEN-A-QUI ABAQ 29.00 [LIC JANITORIAL DISTRIBUTORS
2 ABSORBANT, ALL PURPOSE, MEDIUM GRANULAR FOR LIQUIDS, INCLUDING OIL
(SPEEDI DRI), SAF-T OIL ABSORBANT OR EQUAL - 40 LB.BAG 40 LB. BAG EP MINERALS SLD6007477 8.49 [W. B. MASON
3 ABSORBENT COMPOUND FOR SICKNESS - MINT OR PINE "DRIZ-IT" OR EQUAL -
1LB. BOX 24/CASE STARDUST 4VB23 7.51 |GRAINGER INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
4 AMMONIA, CLEAR, - 1 GAL.
4/CASE KIK SLD6299456 10.39 |W. B. MASON
5 ANGLE BROOM, SYNTHETIC 56" FIBER W/WOODEN HANDLE, TRIM LENGTH 7-
1/2", SWEEP FACE 12", WILEN E507012 OR EQUAL 12/CASE CONTINENTAL CONE507012 64.08 [HILL & MARKES
6 BACKPACK VACUUM, PROTEAM SUPERCOACH PRO 10 W/TOOLS #107303
NO SUBSTITUTIONS EACH Pro-Team 107303 323.40 |E A MORSE
7 BACKPACK VACUUM, PROTEAM SUPERCOACH PRO 6 W/TOOLS #107310
NO SUBSTITUTIONS EACH Pro-Team 107310 317.40 |E A MORSE
8 BASEBOARD & WALL SCRUBBER WITH HANDLE ON SWIVEL BLOCK & ADAPTED
FOR REPLACEABLE WOVEN PADS. (3M DOODLEBUG) EACH Malish 3210 739900 & 472082 7.20 |E A MORSE
9 BASEBOARD STRIPPER - 19 OZ.
12/CASE 3M 3U123 11.17 |GRAINGER INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
10 |[BATHROOM CLEANER - BATHMATE - NON-ACID - 1.5 GALS.
NO SUBSTITUTIONS 2/CASE DIVERSEY 10A344 144.43 |GRAINGER INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
11  |[BATHROOM CLEANER, DEORDORIZER - DIVERSEY CREW NA-SC NON-ACID - 1 QT.
NO SUBSTITUTIONS 12/CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
12 |BATHROOM CLEANER, IN READY TO USE CONTAINER - SPARTAN GREEN
SOLUTIONS -1 QT. - NO SUBSTITUTIONS 12/CASE Spartan 790555 25.18 |E AMORSE
13 |[BATHROOM CLEANER/DISINFECTANT - SURETY 3.78 LTR.- NO SUBSTITUTIONS
4/CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
14  [BATTERIES - "9V" ALKALINE
12/PACK DURACELL DURPC1604BKD 11.69 |W. B. MASON
15 [BATTERIES - "AA" ALKALINE
24/PACK DURACELL DURPC1500BKD 5.54 [W. B. MASON
16  |BATTERIES - "AAA™ ALKALINE
12/PACK Duracell PC1300 9.72 |E A MORSE
17 |BATTERIES - "C" ALKALINE
24/PACK | Duracell **12/PACK** PC1400 6.94 |E A MORSE
18  |[BATTERIES - "D" ALKALINE
12/PACK Duracell PC1300 9.72 |E A MORSE
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DUTCHESS BOCES COOPERATIVE CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES BID #1617-11
CONTRACT PERIOD: January 1, 2017 through December 31, 2017

UNIT

BRAND NAME

ITEM # DESCRIPTION SPECIFIED AWARDED CATALOG # PRICE/UNIT VENDOR
19 BLEACH, CLOROX ULTRA (6% SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE) (OR EQUAL) 1 GAL.
6/CASE KIK K1K 11008635042 8.09 |W. B. MASON
20 BROOM HANDLE - WOODEN 54" THREADED END, BOARDWALK BRAND OR
EQUAL EACH BAM WOOD 5NJJ8 2.63 |GRAINGER INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
21 BROOM HANDLE, 6' WITH 15/16 THREAD, HARDWOOD LACQUERED FINISH,
CARLISLE BRAND OR EQUAL EACH Carlisle 472082 2.24|E A MORSE
22 BROOM, ANGLE - 55", FULLER BRUSH BRAND OR EQUAL
EACH Fuller Brush #6410 5.00 |LJC JANITORIAL DISTRIBUTORS
23 BROOM, CORN HEAVY DUTY BLACK JANITOR TYPE #6, W/6 SEWINGS - MAIDS
CORN - NO SUBSTITUTIONS EACH O'dell 296001 14.49 |E A MORSE
24 BROOM, LOBBY, TOY CORN BROOM BRAND OR EQUAL
EACH TOUGH GUY 34F930 2.57 |GRAINGER INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
25 BROOM, STREET, 16", 100% BASS FIBER 6 1/4" TRIM, FLARE STYLE W/6' HANDLE
EACH Carlisle 43022516 & 472082 9.38 |E A MORSE
26 BROOM, WISK - TYPE 2, EACH
EACH LAITNER 36FN56 2.80 |GRAINGER INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
27 BUCKET, PLASTIC 10 QTS.
12/CASE IMPACT 39FC98 11.69 |GRAINGER INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
28 BUFFING SPRAY - SPARTAN SPRAY BUFF - GSC -1 QT. BOTTLES
NO SUBSTITUTIONS 12/CASE Spartan 7904733 24.55 |E A MORSE
29 BURNISHER MACHINE - TENNANT - BATTERY MACHINE & PARTS - PERCENTAGE WINDSOR WINDSOR 15% OFF MSRP
DISCOUNT OFF CATALOG PRICE EACH EQUIPMENT LINE CATALOG OCEAN JANITORIAL SUPPLY
30 BURNISHER MACHINE - TENNANT - ELECTRIC MACHINES ONLY - PERCENTAGE WINDSOR WINDSOR 15% OFF MSRP
DISCOUNT OFF CATALOG PRICE BACH EQUIPMENT LINE CATALOG OCEAN JANITORIAL SUPPLY
31 BURNISHER MACHINE WITH DUST COLLECTION - 20", 2000RPM W/DUST
CONTROL, VIPER DRAGON MODEL DR2000DC OR EQUAL EACH Viper DR2000DC 914.15 |E A MORSE
32 CAN LINERS, 15X 9 X33, 0.8 MIL. - EXTRA HEAVY PLASTIC PLEASE
SUPPLY SAMPLES LABELED WITH VENDOR NAME, BID ITEM # AND SIZE 1000/CASE INT-2433-X-Hvy Sample #32 12.98 [INTERBORO PACKAGING
33 CAN LINERS, 16 X 14 X 37, 1.5 MIL, XTRA HEAVY DUTY - BLACK PLEASE
SUPPLY SAMPLES LABELED WITH VENDOR NAME, BID ITEM # AND SIZE 250/CASE INT-161437-Exh Sample #33 18.00 |INTERBORO PACKAGING
34 CAN LINERS, 20 X 13 X 40, 0.62 MIL - BLACK AND CLEAR PLEASE
SUPPLY SAMPLES LABELED WITH VENDOR NAME, BID ITEM # AND SIZE 500/CASE INT-3340-Med Sample #34 20.32 [INTERBORO PACKAGING
35 CAN LINERS, 24 X 33,8 MIL., HEAVY DUTY POLY - CLEAR PLEASE
SUPPLY SAMPLES LABELED WITH VENDOR NAME, BID ITEM # AND SIZE 1000/CASE INT-2433-H Sample #35 17.68 |INTERBORO PACKAGING
36 CAN LINERS, 30 X 36, LOW DENSITY, 1.5 MIL., 20-30 GAL. PLEASE
SUPPLY SAMPLES LABELED WITH VENDOR NAME, BID ITEM # AND SIZE 100/CASE INT-3036-Exh Sample #36 7.48 [INTERBORO PACKAGING
37 CAN LINERS, 33X 39, 1.2 MIL., 33 GAL. CAP. - PROLINK THICKSKINS -
NO SUBSTITUTIONS PLEASE 150/CASE Pro-Link 143830 24.70 |[E A MORSE
SUPPLY SAMPLES LABELED WITH VENDOR NAME, BID ITEM # AND SIZE
38 |CAN LINERS, 38 X 60, 22 MICRONS., 55 GAL. BLACK PLEASE INT-3860-Super Ex-Ex-
SUPPLY SAMPLES LABELED WITH VENDOR NAME, BID ITEM # AND SIZE 150/CASE P Sample #38 22.32 [INTERBORO PACKAGING
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DUTCHESS BOCES COOPERATIVE CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES BID #1617-11
CONTRACT PERIOD: January 1, 2017 through December 31, 2017

UNIT

BRAND NAME

ITEM # DESCRIPTION SFESTETED S CATALOG # PRICE/UNIT VENDOR
39 [CAN LINERS, 40 X 46, LOW DENSITY, 1.3 MIL., 40-45 GAL. - BLACK PLEASE
SUPPLY SAMPLES LABELED WITH VENDOR NAME, BID ITEM # AND SIZE 100/CASE INT-4046-Exh Sample #39 12.64 |[INTERBORO PACKAGING
40  [CANLINERS, 40 X 48, FULL 0.19 MIL. ONLY - BLACK PLEASE
SUPPLY SAMPLES LABELED WITH VENDOR NAME, BID ITEM # AND SIZE 100/CASE | INT-4048-Super Ex-Hvy Sample #40 11.24 |INTERBORO PACKAGING
41  |CARPET BONNETS - 19" MICROFIBER
6/CASE RUBBERMAID 3HKD5 30.61 [GRAINGER INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
42 |CARPET CLEANER -1 QT.BOTTLES
12/CASE | ZEP PROFESSIONAL 3HULS6 5.66 |GRAINGER INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
43 [CARPET CLEANER, BUCKEYE JET STREAM - NO SUBSTITUTIONS BUCKEYE 5305-5000
5 GAL. JETSTREAM 75.53 |OCEAN JANITORIAL SUPPLY
44 |CARPET CLEANING MACHINE - HOOVER COMMERCIAL STEAMVAC, BLACK
#C3820 - NO SUBSTITUTIONS EACH HOOVER 6ENE1 216.83 |GRAINGER INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
45  [CARPET RUNNER, 4' X 8' MINIMUM HEAVY 85 MIL. VINYL, SKID RESISTANT
BACKING. TAPERED EDGES. MINIMUM THICKNESS 5/16" TO 7/16". STAIN
RESISTANT. COARSE TEXTURED. NFSI CERTIFIED. MINIMUM 1 YEAR EACH Apache 4" x 8 STO 4" x8 51.00 |LJC JANITORIAL DISTRIBUTORS
WARRANTY. APACHE BRAND OR EQUAL. SPECIFY COLORS
46  [CARPET RUNNER, 4' X 20' MINIMUM HEAVY 85 MIL. VINYL, SKID RESISTANT
BACKING. TAPERED EDGES. MINIMUM THICKNESS 5/16" TO 7/16". STAIN
RESISTANT. COARSE TEXTURED. NFSI CERTIFIED. MINIMUM 1 YEAR EACH Apache 4 x 20 STO 4’ x 20 125.00 |LJC JANITORIAL DISTRIBUTORS
WARRANTY. APACHE BRAND OR EQUAL. SPECIFY COLORS
47 [CARPET STAIN REMOVER, AEROSOL FOR ALL TYPE OF STAINS. 20 OZ. CANS
SIMONIZ CARPET
12/CASE SPOT REMOVER, SMZS3364012 34.85 |HILL & MARKES
ALLOW 2-3 WEEKS
48  [CARPET SWEEPER - 9.1" WIDTH
EACH  BISSELL COMMERCIAI 36RE54 32.84 |GRAINGER INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
49  [CAUTION WET FLOOR SIGN CONE, SOLUTIONS BRAND OR EQUAL
EACH  |GRAINGER APPROVED 6FHC8 6.57 |GRAINGER INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
50 |CLEANER, TILE & SCUM -LYSOL - HARD WATER STAIN REMOVER - 1 GAL.
NO SUBSTITUTIONS 4/CASE Reckitt REC94201 69.50 |E A MORSE
51 |DEGREASER - DIVERSEY TEMPEST - 1.5 GAL. - NO SUBSTITUTIONS
2ICASE DIVERSEY 15V140 74.68 |GRAINGER INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
52 |DEODORANT SPRAY - PROLINK APPLE Il - NO SUBSTITUTIONS
12/CASE Pro-Link 1370222 52.66 |E A MORSE
53 |[DEODORANTS, URINAL BLOCKS ROUND 4 OZ.
12/CASE NILODOR (302) NIL1000 6.70 |HILL & MARKES
54 |DEODORIZER/ODOR COUNTERACTANT - SURETY 3.78 LTR. - NO SUBSTITUTIONS
4/CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
55  [DISINFECTANT - DIVERSEY MORNING MIST - 1 GAL. - NO SUBSTITUTIONS
P Rl | CPVEREEY MR NE DIV5283038 52.00 [HILL & MARKES
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DUTCHESS BOCES COOPERATIVE CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES BID #1617-11
CONTRACT PERIOD: January 1, 2017 through December 31, 2017

UNIT

BRAND NAME

ITEM # DESCRIPTION SPECIFIED AWARDED CATALOG # PRICE/UNIT VENDOR
56 |DISINFECTANT SPRAY - 100% NATURAL - NON -AEROSOL CAN - 7 OZ. CANS -
PURE ORANGE - NO SUBSTITUTIONS 12/CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
57  |DISINFECTANT, DEODORANT - SPARTAN STERIPHENE I - 20 OZ. -
NO SUBSTITUTIONS 12/CASE Spartan 790440 $ 35.87 |E A MORSE
58  |DISINFECTANT, SPRAY - BACTERICIDAL, VIRUCIDAL, TEBERCULOCIDAL,
FUNGICIDAL - PRO-LINK - 15.5 0Z. - NO SUBSTITUTIONS CASE Pro-Link 137018 $ 45.76 |E A MORSE
59 |DISINFECTANT/DEODORIZER - SPARTAN NABC - 1 QT. - NO SUBSTITUTIONS
12/CASE Spartan 790464 $ 18.02 |E A MORSE
60 |DISPENSER - GRAY - PROLINK OPTIMUM - 1.25 LTR. (42 OZ.) - NO SUBSTITUTIONS
6/CASE Pro-Link 139187 $ 50.70 |E A MORSE
61 |DISPENSER - BLACK - PROLINK OPTIMUM - 2 LTR. (67 OZ.) - NO SUBSTITUTIONS
6/CASE Pro-Link 139162 $ 35.94 |E A MORSE
62 DISPENSING SYSTEMS ARE LISTED AT END OF LIST
63 |DOLLY FOR 55 GAL. TRASH CONTAINER
EACH CONTINENTAL COCP3255BK $ 17.39 |W. B. MASON
64 |DOODLEBUG PADS - BROWN - 3M DOODLEBUG - NO SUBSTITUTIONS
5/CASE 3M (20/CT) MMMO8004 $ 30.88 |W. B. MASON
65 |DOODLEBUG TOOL HOLDER - NO SUBSTITUTIONS
4/CASE M 30097 $ 34.11 | GRAINGER INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
66 |DRAIN OPENER - FLOWEASY 595-703, SIMONIZ OPEN-UP, OR EQUAL - 32 OZ.
12/CASE SIMONIZ OPEN UP SMZ02449012 $ 18.18 |HILL & MARKES
67 |DUST CLOTHS, MICROFIBER - 16" X 16" 12 CT. 12ICASE GOLDENSTAR GSSMC1616B230 $ 8.30 |W. B. MASON
68 |DUST CLOTHS TERRYCLOTH OR ALL-COTTON RAGS - 50 LBS.
50 LBS. BUFFALO 5LVA9 $ 64.47 |GRAINGER INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
69 |DUST CLOTHS, COTTON WIPING RAGS TRIMMED - WHITE
50 LBS. ABILITY ONE 5MN49 $ 19.07 |GRAINGER INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
70 |DUST MOP TREATMENT, WATER SOLUBLE - 14 OZ.
12/CASE Spartan 790565 $ 38.60 |E A MORSE
71 |DUST MOP, MICROFIBER 24" BLUE LOOPED
12/CASE TOUGH GUY INET76 $3.28 eal sold as Case of | -0 |NGER INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
12 for $39.36
72 |DUST PAN, CORRUGATED METAL, MINIMUM 20 GAUGE - 8-1/8" X 12-1/4" X 12-1/4",
CONTINENTAL BRAND OR EQUAL 12/CASE Continental 161715 $ 38.40 |E A MORSE
73 |DUST PAN, POLYPROPYLENE, LONG-HANDLED WITH WHEELS,
OVERALL LENGTH 12 3/4", OVERALL WIDTH 11 5/16"", RUBBERMAID BRAND OR EACH RUBBERMAID 4YJ48 $ 16.84 | GRAINGER INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
EQUAL
74 |ENZYME ODOR COUNTERACTANT - BREAKDOWN - 1.5 GAL. - NO SUBSTITUTIONS
2/CASE DIVERSEY 10A343 $ 130.41 |GRAINGER INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
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DUTCHESS BOCES COOPERATIVE CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES BID #1617-11
CONTRACT PERIOD: January 1, 2017 through December 31, 2017

UNIT

BRAND NAME

ITEM # DESCRIPTION FEETEIES ASIEIS, CATALOG # PRICE/UNIT VENDOR
75  |FACE MASKS, RESPIRATORY FOR DUST/FUMES/MIST
50/CASE Safety Zone 756005 $ 3.90 |E A MORSE
76  |FACIAL TISSUE - MARCAL #2930 - 100/CT. - NO SUBSTITUTIONS
30/CASE MARCAL MRC2930 $ 13.35 |W. B. MASON
77 |FACIAL TISSUE, 2 PLY, WHITE 100 TISSUES/BOX, ELEGANT #4320061
NO SUBSTITUTIONS 30/CASE Elegant 826-100 $ 13.70 |[UNITED SALES USA
78  |FEATHER DUSTER- 13", LAMBSKIN BRAND OR EQUIVALENT
EACH TERE FlEZ‘ﬁTHERS - AHK0612G $ 6.70 |HILL & MARKES
79  |FEATHER DUSTER, GREEN MICROFIBER W/HANDLE, CPI BRAND OR EQUIV.
EACH LIBMAN 3LFP3 $ 3.95 |GRAINGER INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
80  |FINISH MOP - FLAT LOOPED-END 18", RUBBERMAID OR EQUIVALENT
6/CASE RUBBERMAID 2FTT4 $9.96 ea/ $59.76 for 6 |GRAINGER INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
81  |FINISH MOP 20" - PROLINK - NO SUBSTITUTIONS
12/CASE Pro-Link 764119123 $ 95.40 |E A MORSE
82  |FLAG - US CLASSROOM 2 X 3
EACH Annin 21043100 $ 11.24 |E A MORSE
83 |FLOOR CLEANER - SURETY 3.78 LTR. - NO SUBSTITUTIONS
4/CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
84  |FLOOR FINISH - BUCKEYE CASTLEGUARD - 5 GAL. - NO SUBSTITUTIONS BUCKEYE 5125-5000
5GAL. CASTLEGUARD $ 90.75 OCEAN JANITORIAL SUPPLY
85 |FLOOR FINISH - DIVERSEY AMPLIFY -5 GAL. - NO SUBSTITUTIONS
5 GAL. DIVERSEY AMPLIFY DIV5104714 $ 88.75 |HILL & MARKES
86 |FLOOR FINISH - ESSENTIAL SPORT KOTE - 5 GAL. - NO SUBSTITUTIONS
5GAL. Essential 138910 $ 268.00 |E A MORSE
87  |FLOOR FINISH - FULLER APPERANCE 2000 URETHAN FORTIFIED - 5 GAL. -
NO SUBSTITUTIONS 5GAL. Fuller Brush #9645 $ 94.00 [LJC JANITORIAL DISTRIBUTORS
88  |FLOOR FINISH - HIGH SPEED - DIVERSEY GENESIS GX-2003 - NO SUBSTITUTIONS
5GAL. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
89  |FLOOR FINISH - PREMIA - 5 GAL. - NO SUBSTITUTIONS
5GAL. DIVERSEY PREMIA JINJ5039422 $ 71.65 [HILL & MARKES
90  |FLOOR FINISH - SPARTAN I-SHINE - 5 GAL. - NO SUBSTITUTIONS
5GAL. Spartan 7903071 $ 64.36 |E A MORSE
91  |FLOOR FINISH - SPARTAN SUNNYSIDE - 5 GAL. - NO SUBSTITUTIONS
5 GAL. Spartan 790289 $ 47.54 |E AMORSE
92  |FLOOR FINISH & SEALER - SPARTAN GREEN SOLUTIONS -5 GAL. -
NO SUBSTITUTIONS 5 GAL. Spartan 790544 $ 66.52 |[E A MORSE
93  |FLOOR FINISH AND WAX LIQUIDATOR - SPARTAN RINSE FREE - 5 GAL.
NO SUBSTITUTIONS 5 GAL. Spartan 790039 $ 39.48 |E A MORSE
94  |FLOOR SEALER - DIVERSEY GENESIS GX-2001 - 5 GAL. - NO SUBSTITUTIONS
5GAL. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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DUTCHESS BOCES COOPERATIVE CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES BID #1617-11
CONTRACT PERIOD: January 1, 2017 through December 31, 2017

UNIT

BRAND NAME

ITEM # DESCRIPTION SPECIFIED AWARDED CATALOG # PRICE/UNIT VENDOR
95 FLOOR SEALER - SPARTAN ON BASE - 5 GAL. - NO SUBSTITUTIONS
5 GAL. Spartan 790404 48.10 |E A MORSE
96 FLOOR STRIPPER - BUCKEYE REVELATION - 5 GAL. - NO SUBSTITUTIONS
5 GAL. 5032-5000 5032-5000 85.63 |OCEAN JANITORIAL SUPPLY
97 FLOOR STRIPPER - DIVERSEY ICE-STRIP (COLD WATER) - 5 GAL. -
NO SUBSTITUTIONS 5 GAL. DIVERSEY 20J852 137.80 [GRAINGER INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
98 FLOOR STRIPPER - DIVERSEY STRIPPIT - 5 GAL. - NO SUBSTITUTIONS
5 GAL. DIVERSEY 10C425 65.95 | GRAINGER INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
99 FLOOR STRIPPER - SIMONIZE RELEASE - 5 GAL. - NO SUBSTITUTIONS
SIMONIZ RELEASE
5 GAL. ALLOW 2-3 WEEKS SMZR3025005 28.75 |HILL & MARKES
100 FLOOR STRIPPER - SPARTAN GREEN SOLUTIONS - 5 GAL. - NO SUBSTITUTIONS
5 GAL. Spartan 790548 66.99 |[E A MORSE
101 FLOOR STRIPPER - SPARTAN SHINELINE EMULSIFIER PLUS - 5 GAL. -
NO SUBSTITUIONS 5 GAL. Spartan 790019 47.64 |E A MORSE
102 FURNITURE POLISH - PROLINK - 19 OZ. CANS -
NO SUBSTITUTIONS 12/CASE Pro-Link 1370501 36.60 |E A MORSE
103 FURNITURE POLISH, WAX LEMON AEROSOL - 20 OZ.
12/CASE Fuller Brush #91730 25.75|LIC JANITORIAL DISTRIBUTORS
104 GENERAL (ALL) PURPOSE CLEANER/DEGREASER - SURETY 3.78 LTR.
NO SUBSTITUTIONS 4/CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
105 GENESIS GX-2004 CLEANER - NO SUBSTITUTIONS
5 GAL. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
106 GERMICIDAL CLEANER - FULLER BRUSH FULLSAN QUATERNARY -4 GAL/CASE
NO SUBSTITUTIONS 4 GAL./CASE Fuller Brush #9471 73.00 |[LJC JANITORIAL DISTRIBUTORS
107 GLANCE - GLASS & MULTI-SURFACE CLEANER - 64 OZ.
NO SUBSTITUTIONS 4/CASE DIVERSEY 38M489 66.55 [GRAINGER INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
108 GLANCE NON-AMMONIA GLASS CLEANER (GSC) - 1.5 GAL.
NO SUBSTITUTIONS 2/CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
109 GLASS AND SURFACE CLEANER - SURETY 3.78 LTR. - NO SUBSTITUTIONS
4/CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
110 GLASS CLEANER - BETCO GREEN EARTH - 1 GAL. - NO SUBSTITUTIONS
4/CASE Betco 535-04 70.64 |E A MORSE
111 GLASS CLEANER - SPARTAN BIO-RENEWABLES -2 LTR. NO SUBSTITUTIONS
4/CASE Spartan 790660 52.30 |E A MORSE
112 GLASS CLEANER - WINDEX OR EQUAL - 1 GAL.
4/CASE WINDEX 3U560 11.40 |GRAINGER INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
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DUTCHESS BOCES COOPERATIVE CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES BID #1617-11

CONTRACT PERIOD: January 1, 2017 through December 31, 2017

UNIT

BRAND NAME

ITEM # DESCRIPTION PEOIRED R CATALOG # PRICE/UNIT VENDOR
113 |GLOVES, LATEX DISPOSABLE, LIGHT POWDER MEDICAL GRADE - SIZE MEDIUM
1000/CASE STEREX CSWLGPPGM 22.50 |W. B. MASON
114 |GLOVES, LATEX DISPOSABLE, LIGHT POWDER MEDICAL GRADE - SIZE LARGE
1000/CASE STEREX CSWLGPPGL 22.50 |W. B. MASON
115 |GLOVES, LATEX DISPOSABLE, LIGHT POWDER MEDICAL GRADE - SIZE SMALL
1000/CASE STEREX CSWLGPPGS 22.50 |W. B. MASON
116 |GLOVES, LATEX DISPOSABLE, LIGHT POWDER MEDICAL GRADE - SIZE XLARGE
1000/CASE STEREX CSWLGPPGXL 22.50 |W. B. MASON
117 |GLOVES, LATEX POWDER FREE - SIZE LARGE PLEASE
SUPPLY SAMPLES LABELED WITH VENDOR NAME, BID ITEM # AND SIZE 1000/CASE STEREX CSWLGPPFGL 25.50 |W. B. MASON
118 |GLOVES, LATEX POWDER FREE - SIZE MEDIUM PLEASE
SUPPLY SAMPLES LABELED WITH VENDOR NAME, BID ITEM # AND SIZE 1000/CASE STEREX CSWLGPPFGM 25.50 |W. B. MASON
119 |GLOVES, LATEX POWDER FREE - SIZE SMALL PLEASE
SUPPLY SAMPLES LABELED WITH VENDOR NAME, BID ITEM # AND SIZE 1000/CASE STEREX CSWLGPPFGS 25.50 |W. B. MASON
120 |GLOVES, LATEX POWDER FREE - SIZE XLARGE PLEASE
SUPPLY SAMPLES LABELED WITH VENDOR NAME, BID ITEM # AND SIZE 1000/CASE STEREX CSWLGPPFGXL 25.50 |W. B. MASON
121 |GLOVES, NITRILE - SIZE MEDIUM PLEASE
SUPPLY SAMPLES LABELED WITH VENDOR NAME, BID ITEM # AND SIZE
100/BOX Endure-Med-NG Sample #121 2.74|INTERBORO PACKAGING
122 |GLOVES, NITRILE - SIZE LARGE PLEASE
SUPPLY SAMPLES LABELED WITH VENDOR NAME, BID ITEM # AND SIZE
100/BOX Endure-Lrg-NG Sample #122 2.74|INTERBORO PACKAGING
123 |GLOVES, NITRILE - SIZE SMALL PLEASE
SUPPLY SAMPLES LABELED WITH VENDOR NAME, BID ITEM # AND SIZE
100/BOX Endure-Sm-NG Sample #123 2.74|INTERBORO PACKAGING
124 |GLOVES, NITRILE - SIZE XLARGE PLEASE
SUPPLY SAMPLES LABELED WITH VENDOR NAME, BID ITEM # AND SIZE
100/BOX Endure-XL-NG Sample #124 2.74|INTERBORO PACKAGING
125 |GLOVES, NITRILE POWDER FREE - SIZE LARGE PLEASE
SUPPLY SAMPLES LABELED WITH VENDOR NAME, BID ITEM # AND SIZE 1000/CASE STEREX CSWNGPPFGL 30.45 |W. B. MASON
126 |GLOVES, NITRILE POWDER FREE - SIZE MEDIUM PLEASE
SUPPLY SAMPLES LABELED WITH VENDOR NAME, BID ITEM # AND SIZE 1000/CASE STEREX CSWNGPPEGM 30.45 |W. B. MASON
127 |GLOVES, NITRILE POWDER FREE - SIZE SMALL PLEASE
SUPPLY SAMPLES LABELED WITH VENDOR NAME, BID ITEM # AND SIZE i . o
aoo/case | Med Pride/Elara-Sm sample #127 12.80 |INTERBORO PACKAGING
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DUTCHESS BOCES COOPERATIVE CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES BID #1617-11
CONTRACT PERIOD: January 1, 2017 through December 31, 2017

UNIT BRAND NAME
ITEM # DESCRIPTION SPECIFIED AWARDED CATALOG # PRICE/UNIT VENDOR
128 GLOVES, NITRILE POWDER FREE - SIZE XLARGE PLEASE
SUPPLY SAMPLES LABELED WITH VENDOR NAME, BID ITEM # AND SIZE .
100/case | Med Pr:\?;’FE(';ra'XL' sample #128 $ 3.20 |INTERBORO PACKAGING
129 GLOVES, NON LATEX POWDER FREE - SIZE LARGE 100/BOX PLEASE
SUPPLY SAMPLES LABELED WITH VENDOR NAME, BID ITEM # AND SIZE 10/CASE STEREX CSWVGPCPFGL $ 16.95 |W. B. MASON
130 GLOVES, NON LATEX POWDER FREE - SIZE MEDIUM 100/BOX PLEASE
SUPPLY SAMPLES LABELED WITH VENDOR NAME, BID ITEM # AND SIZE 10/CASE STEREX CSWVGPCPFGM $ 16.95 |W. B. MASON
131 GLOVES, NON LATEX POWDER FREE - SIZE SMALL 100/BOX PLEASE
SUPPLY SAMPLES LABELED WITH VENDOR NAME, BID ITEM # AND SIZE 10/CASE STEREX CSWVGPCPFGS $ 16.95 |W. B. MASON
132 GLOVES, NON LATEX POWDER FREE - SIZE XLARGE 100/BOX PLEASE
SUPPLY SAMPLES LABELED WITH VENDOR NAME, BID ITEM # AND SIZE 10/CASE STEREX CSWVGPCPFGXL $ 16.95 |W. B. MASON
133 GRAFFITI REMOVER, BIORENEWABLE WITH A MINIMUM FLASH POINT - 32 OZ,,
SPARTAN OR EQUAL 12/CASE DYMON 90,130.00 $ 54.00 [LJC JANITORIAL DISTRIBUTORS
134 GRAFFITI SCRUBS, GRAFFITI AND SPRAY PAINT REMOVER WIPES -
30/CONTAINER, DYMON BRAND OR EQUAL 6/CASE TOUGH GUY 5EWC2 $7.07 EA; $42.42/CS |GRAINGER INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
135 GRASS/FERTILIZER SPREADER 100# WITH COVER, CHAPIN BRAND OR EQUAL
EACH EARTHWAY 4WR65 $ 159.72 |GRAINGER INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
136 GREASE SOLVENT, CITRUS HEAVY DUTY MULTIPURPOSE - 20 OZ. CANS,
PROLINK OR EQUAL 12/CASE Pro-Link 137065 $ 36.93 |E A MORSE
137 GREASE TRAP TREATMENT -1 GAL., SIMONIZ DIGEST OR EQUAL
4/CASE SIMONIZ DIGEST SMZD0860004 $ 24.95 |HILL & MARKES
138 HAND SANITIZER, CLARIO, NON-ALCOHOL. 1000 ML. BOX THAT FITS 91821
DISPENSER PROVIDED AT N/C. - NO SUBSTITUTIONS 6/CASE Clario 7077829 $ 48.58 |E A MORSE
139 HAND SANITIZER, PURELL INSTANT HAND SANITIZER, 8 OZ.
NO SUBSTITUTIONS 12/CASE GOJO G0J956212CT $ 36.80 |W. B. MASON
140 HYDROGEN PEROXIDE CLEANER - DIVERSEY PERDIEM 1.5 GAL.
NO SUBSTITUTIONS 2/CASE DIVERSEY 15V143 $ 169.68 | GRAINGER INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
141 PEROXIDE CLEANER - SURETY 3.78 LTR. (1 GALLON EACH) - NO SUBSTITUTIONS
4/CASE DIVERSEY 11Y608 $ 28.31 |GRAINGER INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
142 ICE MELT, WITH ISOTRO/2, EFFECTIVE TO -20F W/PLASTIC INTERLINER.
WALTON MARCH ICE FOE (OR EQUAL) 50 LB. BAG KISSNER KISMERLINBAG $ 7.69 [W. B. MASON
143 IONATOR EXP - CONVERTS TAP WATER INTO IONIZED WATER. KILLS HARMFUL
BACTERIA AND THE H1IN1 VIRUS EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
144 JANITORIAL CART - RUBBERMAID #6173 OR EQUAL
EACH Impact 6850 739301 $ 90.80 |E A MORSE
145 LIMESCALE REMOVER CLEANER - 1 GAL., SIMONIZ OR EQUAL
4/CASE SIMONIZ LIMESCALE SMZL.2125004 $ 22.28 |HILL & MARKES
146 LIQUID ENZYME CLEANER TO KEEP GREASE TRAPS OPEN. ALSO DEORDORIZE
BATHROOM FLOORS, ETC. - 1 QT. 12/CASE TOUGH GUY 36XX45 $ 12.91 |GRAINGER INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
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DUTCHESS BOCES COOPERATIVE CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES BID #1617-11
CONTRACT PERIOD: January 1, 2017 through December 31, 2017

UNIT

BRAND NAME

ITEM # DESCRIPTION SPECIFIED AWARDED CATALOG # PRICE/UNIT VENDOR
147 [MAGIC ERASER - MR. CLEAN OR EQUAL - WHITE MELAMINE FOAM W/YELLOW
FIRMING STRIP - USES ONLY WATER 24/CASE Fuller Brush #7150 $21.60/caseof 30  |LJC JANITORIAL DISTRIBUTORS
148 |[MOP BUCKET & WRINGER - 26 QTS. - RUBBERMAID WAVEBRAKE - WITH RUBBERMAID
CASTERS - NO SUBSTITUIONS -
EACH ALLOW 2.3 WEEKS RUBFG748000YEL 71.50 [HILL & MARKES
149 [MOP BUCKET & WRINGER 26 QTS. WITH CASTERS
EACH Continental 7392835 37.78 |E A MORSE
150 |[MOP BUCKET & WRINGER, 38 QTS. WITH CASTERS
EACH Continental 7392934 43.20 |E A MORSE
151 |MOP BUCKET 6 GAL. MICRO FIBER WET MOP BUCKET
EACH CPI PTBucket 26.58 |E A MORSE
152 [MOP HANDLE - 60" QUICK CHANGE DRY MOP HANDLE, PROLINK OR EQUAL
EACH BOARDWALI &2 BWKG605 5.59 |W. B. MASON
INCH)
153 [MOP HANDLE - 60" WOODEN SPRING WET MOP HANDLE, FULLER BRUSH OR
EQUAL EACH ABILITY ONE 5MM87 7.48 |GRAINGER INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
154  [MOP HEAD - 32 OZ. PROLINK LOOP END 'BLEND" - NO SUBSTITUTIONS
EACH Pro-Link 764160323 4.20 |E A MORSE
155 |MOP HEAD - MEDIUM BLUE MICROFIBER WET LOOP
12/CASE Pro-Link W32MDB5 73.20 |E A MORSE
156 |MOP HEAD - MEDIUM GREEN MICROFIBER WET LOOP
12/CASE Pro-Link W32MDG5 73.20 |E A MORSE
157 |MOP HEAD - LARGE BLUE MICROFIBER WET LOOP
12/CASE Persia BLU-LRG 84.00 [LIC JANITORIAL DISTRIBUTORS
158 |[MOP HEAD - WET MOP, COTTON 4 PLY - 16 OZ. - MULTI COLORED (BLUE, RED,
YELLOW, GREEN, ORANGE, WHITE) 12/CASE TOUGH GUY 1TYR3 $3.24 EA; $38.88/CS |GRAINGER INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
159  [MOP HEAD - WET MOP, COTTON 4 PLY - 20 OZ. - MULTI COLORED (BLUE, RED,
YELLOW, GREEN, ORANGE, WHITE) 12/CASE TOUGH GUY 1TYR4 $4.00 EA; $48.00/CS |GRAINGER INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
160 |MOP HEAD - WET MOP, COTTON 4 PLY - 20 OZ. - MULTI COLORED (BLUE, RED, ]
YELLOW, GREEN, ORANGE, WHITE) 12/CASE TOUGH GUY 1TYR5 $3.92 EA; $47.04/CS |GRAINGER INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
161 |MOP HEAD - CUT END WITH 5" HEAD BAND - PROLINK #W?7316 - 16 OZ. -
NO SUBSTITUTIONS 12/CASE Pro-Link 764154127 38.16 [E A MORSE
162 |MOP HEAD - CUT END WITH 5" HEAD BAND - PROLINK #W?7316 - 24 OZ. -
NO SUBSTITUTIONS 12/CASE Pro-Link W7324 764154129 52.44 |E A MORSE
163 |MOP WRINGERS - DOWNWARD PRESSURE - CONTICO SW7 #739291
NO SUBSTITUTIONS EACH Continental 739201 43.20 |E A MORSE
164 |MULTI-PURPOSE CLEANER - PROLINK PRO ORANGE - 1 QT. RTU
NO SUBSTITUTIONS 12/CASE Pro-Link 138810 39.40 [E A MORSE
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DUTCHESS BOCES COOPERATIVE CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES BID #1617-11
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UNIT

BRAND NAME

ITEM # DESCRIPTION SPECIFIED AWARDED CATALOG # PRICE/UNIT VENDOR
165 |MULTIPURPOSE CLEANER - SPARTAN CLEAN BY PEROXY. -1 GAL.
NO SUBSTITUTIONS 4/CASE Spartan 7900181 48.32 |E A MORSE
166 MULTI-PURPOSE CLEANER - SPARTAN XCELENTE - 41 GALLON/CASE. MFR #0019
4/CASE Spartan 790016 26.80 |[E A MORSE
167  |MULTI-PURPOSE CLEANER - SPARTAN XCELENTE 24 - 2 LITER, 4/CASE. MFR #4803
4/CASE Spartan 4803 34.16 |[E AMORSE
168  |ON-SITE CLEANING AND DISINFECTING/SANITIZING SOLUTIONS GENERATOR
KIT - includes generator, water softener, dispener,40#/18 kg softener salt, wall & floor
mounting hardware, (50) MultiMicro™200 Spray Bottle Labels, (100) MultiSurface Cleaner
Spray Bottle Labels, pH test paper, Chlorine test paper, Wall Chart, Cleaning Guide, EACH GenEon INTO1 552001 5,995.00 |E A MORSE
Operator Manual, Installation Instruction Bulletin, SDS Sheets. Includes delivery, installation
and in-service.
169  |ON-SITE SATELLITE DUAL STARTER SYSTEM - (MSC/MM) - 2.5G/9.7L. - includes (1)
AS20049 2.5G/9.5 L Transport Container, MultiSurface Concentrate; (1)AS20047 2.5G/9.5 L
Transport Container, MultiMicro™ Concentrate; (2) AS20036 Connection Kit, MultiSurface -
For filling Transport Containers from 0s3 generator or Dispensing from Satellite Dispenser.
Includes 10 ft./3 M of tubing, wall-mount clips and mating connector to MultiSurface
Transport Container; (2) AS20035 Connection Kit, MultiMicro™ - For filling Transport
Containers from o0s3 generator or Dispensing from Satellite Dispenser. Includes 10 ft./3 M of EACH N RIS NG EIIE
tubing, assembly, wall-mount bracket for MultiMicro Transport Container and mounting NOBID NO BID
hardware; (1) AS20031 Satellite Dispenser; (1) AS20096 Assy., Supply Line 1/2'* Tube with
Adapter. Orbio 0s3 Satellite Installation Service - includes unboxing, assembly, configuring
and start-up of satellite, mounting, hook-up to dedicated water supply, and drain lines.
170 |ORANGE FOAM SPRAY CLEANER - ALL NATURAL - 19 OZ. FRESH/CLEAN SCENT,
CLAIRE OR EQUAL 12/CASE Claire CS239 21.28 |[E AMORSE
171 PADS - 20 WHITE
5/CASE ACS ACS4120 10.49 (W. B. MASON
172 |PADS - 20" - 3M PINK ERASER - NO SUBSTITUIONS
5/CASE ACS ACS3620 10.49 |W. B. MASON
173 PADS - 20" - MAROON
10/CASE AMERICO GNR420720 43.10 |HILL & MARKES
174  |PADS - 20" 3M #SSP20 - NO SUBSTITUTIONS
3M - SOLD 10/CS
5/CASE ONLY @ $77.76/CS MMM29592 38.88 [HILL & MARKES
175 PADS - 20" 3M SAFFIRE #66 - NO SUBSTITUTIONS
5/CASE 3M 451518 53.10 |E A MORSE
176 PADS - 20" BLACK
5/CASE ACS ACS7220 10.49 (W. B. MASON
177 PADS - 20" BLACK 3M #7200 - NO SUBSTITUTIONS.
5/CASE 3M MMMO08382 22.75 |HILL & MARKES
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BRAND NAME

ITEM # DESCRIPTION SPECIFIED AWARDED CATALOG # PRICE/UNIT VENDOR
178 PADS - 20" BLACK 3M #7300 - HIGH PRODUCTIVITY PAD - NO SUBSTITUTIONS
5/CASE 3M MMMO082788 $ 43.55 |HILL & MARKES
179 PADS - 20" BLACK HEAVY DUTY 5/CASE ACS ACS7220 $ 10.49 [W. B. MASON
180 PADS - 20" BLUE 5/CASE ACS ACS5320 $ 10.49 [W. B. MASON
181 PADS - 20" BUFF - HIGH SPEED SPRAY, GORILLA/JAGUAR/HOGS HAIR 5/CASE ACS ACS3520 $ 10.49 [W. B. MASON
182 PADS - 20" RED
5/CASE ACS ACS5120 $ 10.49 |W. B. MASON
183 PADS - 20" RED - THICK SPRAY BUFF
5/CASE ACS ACS5120 $ 10.49 |W. B. MASON
184 PADS - 20" TAN - 3M - NO SUBSTITUTIONS
5/CASE 3M MMM19008 $ 22.75 |HILL & MARKES
185 PAINT, FIELD MARKING - COLOR: WHITE -5 GAL. PAIL TO BE DILUTED TO 12
GALLONS. WATER BASED 5 GAL. SAPOLIN 209W05 $ 59.75 |POLLACK PAINT & FIELD
186 PAINT, FIELD MARKING - COLOR: YELLOW, BLUE, RED & ORANGE - 5 GAL. PAIL
TO BE DILUTED TO 12 GALLONS. WATER BASED 5 GAL. SAPOLIN 209BRYO $ 69.75 |POLLACK PAINT & FIELD
187 PAPER TOWEL FOR enMOTION #89460. DISPENSER PROVIDED AT N/C - NO 6/CASE GEORGIA PACIFIC GPC89460 $ 44.69 |W. B. MASON
SUBSTITUTES
188 PAPER TOWEL ROLL - BAYWEST ECOSOFT GREEN SEAL 31000 - 1000' ROLL -
NO SUBSTITUTIONS 6/CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
189 PAPER TOWEL ROLL - PROLINK ELITE SYSTEM RH-713, 800'/ROLLS. HANDS FREE
DISPENSER MUST BE PROVIDED AT N/C. - NO SUBSTITUTIONS 6/CASE Pro-Link 450344 $ 34.20 |E A MORSE
190 PAPER TOWEL ROLL - WHITE; 8" X 1000" - KIMBERLY CLARK SCOTT #01005
NO SUBSTITUTIONS 6/CASE KIMBERLY CLARK KCC01005 $ 34.75 |W. B. MASON
191 PAPER TOWEL ROLL, 1.9" CORE, NATURAL, 800'. BAYWEST RH813/313 -
GREENSEAL CERTIFIED - DISPENSER MUST BE PROVIDED AT N/C 6 /CASE BayWest 450339 $ 34.20 |E A MORSE
NO SUBSTITUTIONS
192 PAPER TOWEL ROLL, BAYWEST #3156Y - DISPENSER MUST BE PROVIDED AT N/C.
NO SUBSTITUTIONS 6/CASE BayWest 450338 $ 37.80 |E A MORSE
193 PAPER TOWELS, BAYWEST ECO0-SOFT #460 TURN TOWELS 8" 100% RECYCLED.
NO SUBSTITUTIONS 12/CASE BAYWEST BAY460 $ 21.25 |HILL & MARKES
194 PAPER TOWEL ROLL, BAYWEST DUBI-NATURE GREEN SEAL - 1000" ROLL
NO SUBSTITUTIONS 6/CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
195 PAPER TOWELS - SINGLE FOLD - 10- 3/4 X 8- 3/4
4000/CASE BayWest 45022 $ 16.05 |[E A MORSE
196 PLASTIC BUCKET 14 QTS. WITH HANDLE
EACH GRAINGER APPROVEL| 49EN26 $ 4.39 |GRAINGER INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
197 RAINDANCE - CLEANER - (GSC) - 1.5 GAL. - NO SUBSTITUTIONS
2/CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
198 RAZOR BLADES-SINGLE EDGE FOR RAZOR SCRAPERS
100/CASE HYDE 9CRU2 $ 7.59 [GRAINGER INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
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CONTRACT PERIOD: January 1, 2017 through December 31, 2017
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199 RAZOR SCRAPERS
EACH IMPACT IMP3410 1.66 |HILL & MARKES
200 RECEPTACLE, RECYCLE, 10 GAL.
EACH TOUGH GUY 4UAUG 5.29 [GRAINGER INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
201 RECYCLING RECEPTACLE, 23 GAL. - 20W X 11D X 30H
4/CASE RUBBERMAID 2FTG5 43.00 |GRAINGER INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
202 REJUVINATOR - SPARTAN BOUNCEBACK - 5 GAL. - NO SUBSTITUTIONS
5 GAL. Spartan 790339 54.78 |E A MORSE
203 ROCK SALT FOR SNOW & ICE REMOVAL - 50 LB. BAG
50 LB. BAG HALITE CAR50RS 5.50 [HILL & MARKES
204 RUBBER, VINYL, PLASTIC, LEATHER & METAL SURFACES CLEANER - 1 QT.
12/CASE Betco 7015512 52.80 |[E A MORSE
205 RUG SHAMPOO, DRY FOAM TYPE, - SPARTAN PLUS 5 N.F. DRY FOAM - 1 GAL.
NO SUBSTITUTIONS 4/CASE Spartan 790245 31.76 |E A MORSE
206  [SANDING PADS - 20" - 80 GRIT
10/CASE Pro-Link 11180 39.80 |[E A MORSE
207  [SANDING PADS - 20" - 100 GRIT
10/CASE Pro-Link 11178 35.40 |E A MORSE
208  [SANDING PADS - 20" - 100 GRIT 3M - NO SUBSTITUTIONS
12/CASE 3M 29823 92.88 |E A MORSE
209  [SANDING PADS - 20" - 120 GRIT
10/CASE Pro-Link 11177 33.00 [E A MORSE
210  [SANDING PADS - 20 "* - 220 GRIT - PROLINK - NO SUBSTITUTIONS
10/CASE Pro-Link FW720 36.40 |E A MORSE
211 [SANITARY NAPKIN BAGS - 17" X 18" FOR PROLINK CONELESS TUFFSKINS
#SN61718 - NO SUBSTITUTIONS 2000/CASE Pro-Link 143171804 20.58 |E A MORSE
212 [SANITARY NAPKIN BAGS FOR RUBBERMAID #6141 - NO SUBSTITUTIONS
250/CASE RUBBERMAID RUB6141 18.85 |HILL & MARKES
213 [SCOURING PADS, BRILLO - HOTEL SIZE - 10/BOX - NO SUBSTITUTIONS
12/CASE DICSO DSCSP121BRILLO 26.95 [HILL & MARKES
214 |SCOURING PADS, GREEN 9.5 X 6 - 10 PK., ACS SCRUBBLE OR EQUAL
10/PK. ACS Scrubble 140201 1.96 |E AMORSE
215 [SCOURING POWDER - COMET (OR EQUAL) - 21 0OZ.
24/CASE BABO CALICCP752088 16.09 |W. B. MASON
216  |SCRUB BRUSH - PROLINK #780100 W/HANDLE 20 LB. HEAVYWEIGHT -
NO SUBSTITUTIONS EACH Pro-Link 230360 & 472082 9.89 [E A MORSE
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217 SCRUBBING PADS - 20" GREEN SCRUB
5/CASE ACS ACS5520 10.49 |W. B. MASON
218 SCRUBBING PADS, NYLON-SPONGE , SCOTCH-BRITE #74 (OR EQUAL)
40/CASE BOARDWALK BWK174 10.95 |W. B. MASON
219 SOAP, HAND - LIQUID - ALMONDJOY
5 GAL. TOUGH GUY 34TC35 12.17 |GRAINGER INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
220 SOAP, HAND FOAMING - BUCKEYE SYMMETRY GREEN SEAL - 1250 ML.
NO SUBSTITUTIONS 6/CASE Buckeye 90900911 42.94 |E A MORSE
221 SOAP, HAND - GOJO 5261 - 2000ML - DISPENSER SUPPLIED AT N/C.
NO SUBSTITUTIONS
2/CASE GOJO 5261 34.50 |UNITED SALES USA
222 SOAP, FOAM LIGHT PINK, KIMCARE GENERAL LUXURY FOAM
W/MOISTURIZERS. 1000 ML. (1LTR.); DISPENSERS PROVIDED BY VENDOR AT N/C
AND REPLACED AS NEEDED INCLUDING PARTS. ALL DIPENSERS MUST BE
IMPREGNATED WITH MICROBAN - NO SUBSTITUTIONS 6/CASE PROVON 34TC33 43.01 |GRAINGER INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
223 SOAP, HAND FOAMING - ANTI MICROBIAL FOR PROLINK DISPENSER - 1.25 LTR. -
NO SUBSTITUTIONS 6/CASE Pro-Link 139178 52.07 |E A MORSE
224 SOAP, HAND FOAMING - PROLINK OPTIMUM GREEN CERTIFIED #MH255 - 1250
ML. - NO SUBSTITUTIONS 2/CASE Pro-Link **3/Case** 139182 46.72 |E A MORSE
225 SPONGES WITH GREEN SCRUB PAD - 20/CASE, ACS SCRUBBLE OR EQUAL
20/CASE BOARDWALK BWK174 10.95 |W. B. MASON
226 SPONGES, SCOTCH-BRITE #63 - NO SUBSTITUTIONS
20/PK 3M SCOTCH BRITE MMMO08251 29.35 |HILL & MARKES
227 SPRAY BOTTLES - 32 OZ. SIZE PLASTIC - MUST INCLUDE TRIGGER SPRAYER,
IMPACT BRAND OR EQUAL 12/CASE IMPACT IMP5032WG & IMP4902 9.96 |HILL & MARKES
228 SQUEEGEE, CURVED 24" WIDTH, IMPACT OR EQUAL
EACH TOUGH GUY 1ZBZ1 11.04 |GRAINGER INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
229 SQUEEGEE, FLOOR WATER WAND - 22" WIDTH, UNGER OR EQUAL
EACH Unger 860140 9.88 |E A MORSE
230 STAINLESS STEEL CLEANER, LIQUID - 20 OZ., CLAIRE OR EQUAL
12/CASE Claire 137234 23.86 |E A MORSE
231 STONE SEALER - DIVERSEY IRON STONE - 5 GAL. - NO SUBSTITUTIONS
5 GAL. DIVERSEY 10A327 100.39 [GRAINGER INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
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232 TAMPONS - PLAYTEX (OR EQUAL) - INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED
500/CASE HOSPECO HSPT500 50.75 |HILL & MARKES
233 TERRAZO SEALER - SPARTAN TERRA-GLAZE -5 GAL. - NO SUBSTITUTIONS
5 GAL. Spartan 790409 63.70 |[E A MORSE
234 TILT TRUCK, TRUCK SIZE 1 CUBIC YD., CONSTRUCTION STANDARD, MAX. LOAD
2100 LBS. 12" WHEELS, 2 CASTERS, 70-3/4" X 42-1/4" X 33-1/2". EACH RUBBERMAID 3LU62 684.35 | GRAINGER INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
235 TOILET BOWL BRUSH, 19" W/WHITE TAMPICO OR 19" BLACK NYLON
EACH Continental 7396310 1.44 |E A MORSE
236 TOILET BOWL CLEANER - POWERFUL DETERGENT CLEANER WITH
GERMICIDAL IODINE PLUS A QUATERNARY. TO BE SIMILAR OR EQUAL TO 12/CASE Spartan 790461 17.68 |E A MORSE
SPARTAN GERMICIDAL BOWL CLEANER. 1QT.
237 TOILET BOWL PLUNGER - HEAVY DUTY - EACH
EACH UNISAN UNS9201 2.89 |W. B. MASON
238 TOILET BOWL SWAB - ACRILON HEAD 12" PLASTIC HANDLE
EACH Continental 330001 0.62 |E AMORSE
239 TOILET SEAT COVER DISPENSER
EACH HOSPECO HSPHG12 5.55 |HILL & MARKES
240 TOILET SEAT COVERS - PAPER
5000/CASE HOSPECO HSPDS5000 22.40 |HILL & MARKES
241 TOILET TISSUE - BAYWEST ECOSOFT GREEN SEAL 12990 - 1-PLY - 1755 SHEET
ROLL - REVOLUTION AND DUBL-SERYV DISPENSER SUPPLIED AT N/C - NO 36/CASE BayWest 450923 57.35 |E AMORSE
SUBSTITUTIONS
242 TOILET TISSUE - BAYWEST ECOSOFT GREEN SEAL 61990 865 SHEET ROLL -
REVOLUTION AND DUBL-SERV DISPENSER SUPPLIED AT N/C - NO
SUBSTITUTIONS 36/CASE BayWest 450922 50.69 |E A MORSE
243 TOILET TISSUE - MORCON VALAY, 2 PLY 1250" ROLL - NO SUBSTITUTIONS
24/CASE Morcon 340m 29.00 |UNITED SALES USA
244 TOILET TISSUE - PROLINK JT2001, 2000° - NO SUBSTITUTIONS
12/CASE Pro-Link 450916 33.08 |E A MORSE
245 TOILET TISSUE - PROLINK RR 216/616, 2 PLY, 1250'/ROLL - DISPENSER MUST BE
PROVIDED AT N/C. NO SUBSTITUTIONS. 48/CASE Pro-Link 450905 47.85 |E A MORSE
246 TOILET TISSUE - PROLINK JT1002A - 2 PLY - 1000' ROLL - NO SUBSTITUTIONS
12/CASE Pro-Link 450951 27.73 |E A MORSE
247 TOILET TISSUE - SCOTT CORELESS JRT JR. BATHROOM TISSUE - WHITE 3.78" X
1150" - MUST BE IMPREGNATED WITH MICROBAN - NO SUBSTITUTIONS - 12/CASE KIMBERLY CLARK KCC07006 38.09 |W. B. MASON
248 TOILET TISSUE - SCOTT CORELESS JRT JR. BATHROOM TISSUE - WHITE 3.78" X
2300" - #7005 - MUST BE PREGNATED WITH MICROBAN - NO SUBSTITUTIONS - 12/CASE KIMBERLY CLARK KCC07005 43.08 |W. B. MASON
249 TOILET TISSUE, - MORCON VALAY #1304 - 2500" ROLL - DISPENSERS PROVIDED AT
DISTRIBUTOR COST 24/CASE Morcon 304m 28.50 |UNITED SALES USA
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250 TOPDRESSING FOR BASEBALL FIELDS - TURFACE QUICKDRY
NO SUBSTITUTIONS 50 LB. BAG TURFACE QDMVP 10.62 |POLLACK PAINT & FIELD
251 TRAFFIC CONE - 36", RUBBERMAID OR EQUAL
EACH GRAINGER APPROVEL 6FGZ3 11.24 |GRAINGER INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
252 TRASH RECEPTACLE/LID - 10 GAL. RUBBER
EACH Continental 739023 & 739021 11.78 |E AMORSE
253 TRASH RECEPTACLE/LID - 32 GAL. RUBBER, CONTINENTAL BRAND OR EQUAL
EACH Continental 7390381 & 739036 22.20 |E A MORSE
254 UTILITY PAD HOLDER, GRAY PLASTIC, SWIVELS IN ALL DIRECTIONS, BASE
ACCEPTS ANY STANDARD HANDLE. EACH Malish 739900 5.15 |E A MORSE
255 |[VACUUM - CLARKE CARPETMASTER 15" DUAL MOTOR - NO SUBSTITUTIONS
EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
256 VACUUM - PERFECT HEPA VAC W/BUILT IN MAGNET BAR - NO SUBSTITUTIONS
EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
257  |[VACUUM - ROYAL COMMERICAL UPRIGHT, MODEL #CR5130Z
NO SUBSTITUTIONS EACH Royal 7371030 290.38 |[E A MORSE
258 VACUUM - ROYAL COMMERICIAL UPRIGHT, 120 v 10 AMPS. MODEL #CR5158Z -
NO SUBSTITUTIONS EACH ROYAL 6ENE7 296.75 |GRAINGER INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
259  [VACUUM - WET/DRY - VIPER SHOVEL NOSE - 18 GAL. WET/DRY VAC WITH TOOLS,
24" FRONT MOUNTED SQUEEGEE MODEL #SN18WD- NO SUBSTITUTIONS EACH Viper 9250020 501.18 |E A MORSE
260 VACUUM - WET/DRY - 20 GAL.
EACH DAYTON 22XJ56 663.68 | GRAINGER INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
261 é,:(LZUUM - WET/DRY W/FRONT MOUNT SQUEEGEE AND ONBOARD TOOLS - 20 EACH TORNADO 21YG59 519.78 |GRAINGER INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
262 [VACUUM CLEANER BAGS - ROYAL B - NO SUBSTITUTIONS
10/PKG. Royal 7376603 6.88 |E A MORSE
263 VACUUM CLEANER BAGS - ROYAL Y FOR MODEL #CR50005 - NO SUBSTITUTIONS
8/PKG. Royal ***7/PKG*** 73750006 10.44 |E A MORSE
264 [VACUUM CLEANER BAGS, 10 QT. PROTEAM INTERCEPT MICRO FILTER #100431 -
NO SUBSTITUTIONS 10/PKG. Pro-Team 649022 6.74 |E A MORSE
265 [VACUUM CLEANER BAGS, 6 QT. PROTEAM INTERCEPT MICRO FILTER #100331 -
NO SUBSTITUTIONS 10/PKG. Pro-Team 649020 9.10 |E A MORSE
266 [VACUUM CLEANER BAGS, MINUTEMAN MPV #370202 - NO SUBSTITUTIONS
10/PKG. Minuteman 300370202 10.65 |E A MORSE
267 [VACUUM CLEANER BAGS, PROTEAM 1500 #103483 - NO SUBSTITUTIONS
10/PKG. Pro-Team 6490021 4.78 |E A MORSE
268 |[VACUUM CLEANER BAGS, PROTEAM SUPER COACH PRO 10 (#107313)
NO SUBSTITUTIONS 10/PKG. Pro-Team 6490050 8.56 |[E A MORSE
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269 |[VACUUM CLEANER BELT (TIMING) FOR TENNANT V-DMU-14 #9007744 -
NO SUBSTITUTIONS EACH TENNANT 12H378 14.51 |GRAINGER INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
270 VACUUM CLEANER FILTER FOR PROTEAM SUPER COACH - NO
SUBSTITUTIONS 10/PKG. Pro-Team 100431 7.28 |E AMORSE
271 |VACUUM, PROTEAM PROFORCE 1500 UPRIGHT - NO SUBSTITUTIONS SRS -
EACH 120V WITH TOOLS PRO107252 306.65 |HILL & MARKES
272 |WASTEPAPER BASKET, 10 GAL. - RUBBER/PLASTIC
12/CASE  |TOUGH GUY 4PGL9 31.32 [GRAINGER INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
273 |WASTEPAPER BASKET, 28 QTS. - PLASTIC
EACH CONTINENTAL COCP2818BK 2.69 |W. B. MASON
274 |WAX APPLICATOR - EZ WAY K200 - NO SUBSTITUTIONS
EACH EZ Way 100005 354.98 |E A MORSE
275  |WAX APPLICATOR AND PAD 18" HANDLE BEST GRADE LAMBS WOOL PAD
12/CASE  |WOOSTER 38UX01 8.40 |GRAINGER INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
276 |WAX APPLICATOR REFILLS - 18" PURE LAMBS WOOL
12/CASE Lambskin 15010 22.20 |E AMORSE
277 |WAX APPLICATOR REFILLS - 24" LAMBS WOOL - EZ WAY KV-4400
NO SUBSTITUTIONS 12/CASE EZ Way 100006 36.84 |E A MORSE
278  |WD40 (OR EQUAL) - 11 OZ. CAN
12/CASE WD40 WDF490040 59.15 |W. B. MASON
279 WETTASK WIPE CLOTHS - WHITE - KIMBERLY CLARK SCOTT - KC #KIMB06001
NO SUBSTITUTIONS 6/CASE KIMTECH 2VHUG6 42.81 |GRAINGER INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
280 WINDOW BRUSH - 8" X 2-1/4" WITH 6' HANDLE
EACH LIBMAN 46U293 16.47 |GRAINGER INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
281 WINDOW CLEANING POLE 14’ - OPTILOC OR EQUAL
EACH UNGER 5DUV0 18.59 |GRAINGER INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
282 WINDOW WASHING BUCKET - RUBBERMAID OR EQUAL
EACH Continental 2559 25.10 [E AMORSE
283 WIPES, DISINFECTING - LYSOL - 12/CASE - NO SUBSTITUTIONS LYSOL
12/CASE E008-4 90.00 [OCEAN JANITORIAL SUPPLY
284 WIPES, DISINFECTING - SANI CLOTH PLUS - 200 CT. - NO SUBSTITUTIONS
6/CASE SANI CLOTH NICP22884CT 37.16 |W. B. MASON
285 WIPES, DISINFECTING - CLOROX - 75 CT. - NO SUBSTITUTIONS
6/CASE CLOROX CLO15949CT 22.99 (W. B. MASON
286 WOOD FINISH - BETCO HI TECH -5 GAL. - NO SUBSTITUTIONS
5 GAL. e 7061005 106.37 |E A MORSE
287 WOOD FINISH - BUCKEYE ARENA 300 - 5 GAL. - NO SUBSTITUTIONS BUCKEYE ARENA 300
5 GAL. 5172-5000 277.00 [OCEAN JANITORIAL SUPPLY
288 WOOD FINISH - SPARTAN AQUA SPORT - URETHANEACRYLIC - WATER BASED - 5
GAL. - NO SUBSTITUTIONS 5GAL. Spartan 790383 154.28 |E A MORSE
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DISPENSING SYSTEMS
DISPENSING SYSTEMS: MUST BE ABLE TO SUPPLY & INSTALL AT N/C. ABLE TO MAINTAIN
ON AN AS-NEEDED BASIS ANY PARTS THAT MIGHT BE REQUIRED. PROVIDE REPAIR SERVICE
WITHIN 24-48 HRS AND AN ANNUAL INSPECTION AT N/C.
DIVERSEY CONTROL CENTER
289 |BATHROOM CLEANER - SURETY 3.78 LTR. - NO SUBSTITUTIONS
4/CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
290 BATHROOM CLEANER, NON-ACID - DIVERSEY BATHMATE - 1.5 GALS.
NO SUBSTITUTIONS 2/CASE DIVERSEY 20J844 160.19 |GRAINGER INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
291 |CLEANER, HEAVY DUTY - SPEEDBALL 2000 - 1.5 GAL. - NO SUBSTITUTIONS
2/CASE DIVERSEY 46E779 59.57 |GRAINGER INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
292 DEGREASER, SOLVENT FREE - DIVERSEY TEMPEST - 1.5 GAL. - NO
SUBSTITUTIONS 2/CASE DIVERSEY 15V140 74.68 |GRAINGER INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
293  [DISINFECTANT - MORNING MIST - 1.5 GAL. - NO SUBSTITUTIONS
2/CASE DIVERSEY 10A343 130.41 |GRAINGER INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
294 ENZYME ODOR COUNTERACTANT - BREAKDOWN - 1.5 GAL. - NO SUBSTITUTIONS
2/CASE DIVERSEY 11Y688 99.73 [GRAINGER INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
295 |FLOOR CLEANER - SURETY 3.78 LTR. - NO SUBSTITUTIONS
4/CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
296 GENERAL (ALL) PURPOSE CLEANER/DEGREASER - SURETY 3.78 LTR.
NO SUBSTITUTIONS 4/CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
297  |GLASS AND SURFACE CLEANER - SURETY 3.78 LTR. - NO SUBSTITUTIONS
4/CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
298 MULTI-PURPOSE CLEANER - GLANCE NA GLASS CLEANER (GSC) - 1.5 GAL.
NO SUBSTITUTIONS 2/CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
299 MULTI-SURFACE CLEANER, - ALPHA-HP (GSC) OR EQUAL - 1.5 GAL.
2/CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SPARTAN CLEAN ON THE GO
300 [BATHROOM CLEANER - NABC - CLEAN ON THE GO - 2 LTR. - NO SUBSTITUTIONS
4/CASE Spartan 790606 83.40 |E AMORSE
301 DAMP MOP - SPARTAN CLEAN ON THE GO - 2 LTR. - NO SUBSTITUTIONS
4/CASE Spartan 790613 28.80 |E A MORSE
302 GLASS CLEANER - SPARTAN BIO-RENEWABLES -2 LTR. NO SUBSTITUTIONS
4/CASE Spartan 790660 52.30 |E A MORSE
303 HYDROGEN PEROXIDE ALL-PURPOSE CLEANER - SPARTAN CLEAN BY PEROXY -
2 LTR. - NO SUBSTITUTIONS 4/CASE Spartan 790619 66.20 |E A MORSE
304 MULTI-PURPOSE CLEANER - SPARTAN TRIBASE - 2 LTR. - NO SUBSTITUTIONS
4/CASE Spartan 7906191 46.69 |E A MORSE
305 NEUTRAL DISINFECTANT CLEANER - SPARTAN HDQC2 - 2 LTR. - NO
SUBSTITUTIONS 4/CASE Spartan 790609 42.12 |[E AMORSE
306 SURFACTANT - SPARTAN SMOKE & ODOR ELIMINATOR - 2 LTR. - NO
SUBSTITUTIONS 4/CASE Spartan 790611 168.30 |E A MORSE
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