

Dutchess BOCES Cooperative Milk and Milk Products Bid #1617-06

Award Sheet

Contract Period: July 1, 2016 through June 30, 2017

Description	Unit of Measure	BYRNE DIARY				SINON FARMS, INC.				HUDSON VALLEY FRESH			
		Vendor Item Number	Brand Bid	Price Per Unit	Meets Buy American Provision? (Y or N)	Vendor Item Number	Brand Bid	Price Per Unit	Meets Buy American Provision? (Y or N)	Vendor Item Number	Brand Bid	Price Per Unit	Meets Buy American Provision? (Y or N)
Milk, Fat Free, White	½ pint	500	BYRNE	0.2820	Y		HOOD	0.24	Y	1	HVF	0.0280	Y
Milk, Fat Free, Chocolate	½ pint	385	BYRNE	0.2940	Y		HOOD	0.24	Y	2	HVF	0.0310	Y
Milk, Fat Free, Strawberry	½ pint	394	BYRNE	0.2950	Y		HOOD	0.24	Y	3	HVF	0.0310	Y
Milk, Low Fat 1%, White	½ pint	350	BYRNE	0.2930	Y		HOOD	0.24	Y	4	HVF	0.0290	Y
Milk, Low Fat 2%, White	½ pint	537	BYRNE	0.3050	Y		HOOD	0.24	Y			NO BID	
Milk, Lactose Free, Fat Free	½ pint	304	LACTAID	0.9100	Y		HOOD	0.75	Y			NO BID	
Milk, Lactose Free, 1% Unflavored	½ pint			NO BID			HOOD	0.75	Y			NO BID	
Milk, Low Fat 1%, White, Plastic	½ gallon	332	BYRNE	1.8500	Y		CROWLEY	1.77	Y			NO BID	
Milk, Low Fat 1%, White	1 gallon	25	BYRNE	3.7800	Y		CROWLEY	3.77	Y			NO BID	
Buttermilk, Whole	1 quart	260	BYRNE	1.2200	Y		CROWLEY	1.25	Y			NO BID	
Buttermilk, Low Fat 2%	1 quart			NO BID			CROWLEY	1.25	Y			NO BID	
Half & Half, Ultra Pasteurized	1 quart	449	BYRNE	1.9700	Y		CROWLEY	1.90	Y			NO BID	
Half & Half, Ultra Pasteurized	½ gallon			NO BID			CROWLEY	3.50	Y			NO BID	
Half & Half	½ gallon	415	BYRNE	3.8800	Y		CROWLEY	3.25	Y			NO BID	
Heavy Cream, Ult., 40%	1 quart	399	BYRNE	3.9500	Y		HOOD	4.25	Y			NO BID	
Heavy Cream, 40%	1 quart	395	BYRNE	3.8500	Y		HOOD	4.25	Y			4.2500	Y
Yogurt, Yoplait Light,	18/6 oz.			NO BID				NO BID				NO BID	
Yogurt, Yoplait, French Vanilla	6 oz.			NO BID			CROWLEY	0.70	Y			NO BID	
Yogurt, Yoplait, Strawberry	6 oz.	874	BYRNE	1.0400	Y		CROWLEY	0.70	Y			NO BID	
Yogurt, Yoplait, Raspberry	6 oz.	873	BYRNE	1.0400	Y		CROWLEY	0.70	Y			NO BID	
Yogurt, Yoplait, Blueberry	6 oz.	871	BYRNE	1.0400	Y		CROWLEY	0.70	Y			NO BID	
Yogurt, Yoplait, Peach	6 oz.	872	BYRNE	1.0400	Y		CROWLEY	0.70	Y			NO BID	
Yogurt, Yoplait, Straw/Banana	6 oz.	876	BYRNE	1.0400	Y		CROWLEY	0.70	Y			NO BID	
Yogurt, Crowley, Vanilla	6 oz.	877	BYRNE	1.0400	Y		CROWLEY	0.70	Y			NO BID	
Yogurt, Crowley, Straw/Banana	6 oz.			NO BID			CROWLEY	0.70	Y			NO BID	
Yogurt, Crowley, Strawberry,	6 oz.			NO BID			CROWLEY	0.70	Y			NO BID	
Apple Cider, 100%	Gallon	140	BYRNE	5.2500	Y			NO BID				NO BID	
Orange Juice, 100%	Gallon	35	BYRNE	4.2500	Y		HOOD	4.25	Y			NO BID	
Lowest Overall Bidder for: Hyde Park CSD					Lowest Overall Bidder for: Arlington CSD, Dutchess BOCES, Millbrook CSD, Pawling CSD, Pine Plains CSD, Poughkeepsie CSD, Red Hook CSD, Rhinebeck CSD, Spackenkill UFSD, Wappingers CSD & Webutuck CSD					Lowest Overall Bidder for: Dover UFSD			
All vendors indicated that they will not charge for the coolers requested on the bid document. Please note that there were no bids for the Beacon City School District.													

Byrne Dairy Tom Ruffrage PO Box 176 Lafayette, NY 13084 Email: tom.ruffrage@byrnedairy.com Phone: 315-475-2111 FAX: 315-471-0930	Sinon Farms Inc. G. Michael Sinon 634 Salt Point Road Poughkeepsie, NY 12601 Email: sinonfarms@aol.com Phone: 845-454-9075 FAX: 845-454-9076	Hudson Valley Fresh Dairy LLC Samuel Simon 47 South Hamilton Street Poughkeepsie, NY 12601 Email: cowgrlgail@aol.com Phone: 845-226-3065 FAX: 845-483-9412
---	---	---

Dutchess BOCES Cooperative Milk and Milk Products Bid #1617-06

Award Sheet

Contract Period: July 1, 2016 through June 30, 2017