

DUTCHESS BOCES COOPERATIVE ICE CREAM AND FROZEN TREATS BID #1617-08

Contract Period September 22, 2016 through July 31, 2017

AWARD SHEET

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	UNIT OF MEASURE	PREFERRED BRAND	MEETS BUY AMERICAN PROVISION (YES OR NO)	STOCK NO.	TOTAL PRICE PER UNIT OF MEASURE	AWARDED VENDOR
1	BAR - FRUIT, MANGO	24/2.5 OZ	CHLOE'S	YES	54277	19.20	GILLETTE CREAMERY
2	BAR - CHOCOLATE SCOOTER	36/2.75 OZ	HERSHEY'S	YES	24682-31165	11.16	HERSHEY'S ICE CREAM
3	BAR - COTTON CANDY	24/2.5 OZ	RICH'S	YES	87100	7.92	GILLETTE CREAMERY
4	BAR - FRUIT, RASPBERRY	24/2.5 OZ	CHLOE'S	YES	54278	19.20	GILLETTE CREAMERY
5	BAR - FRUIT, STRAWBERRY	24/2.5 OZ	CHLOE'S	YES	54279	19.20	GILLETTE CREAMERY
6	BAR - FUDGE	24/2.5 OZ	RICH'S	YES	86210	6.96	GILLETTE CREAMERY
7	BAR - FUDGE-0	36/2 OZ	HERSHEY'S	YES	24682-31152	9.72	HERSHEY'S ICE CREAM
8	BAR - ORANGE BLOSSOM	36/2.5 OZ	HERSHEY'S	YES	24682-31174	9.72	HERSHEY'S ICE CREAM
9	BAR - ORANGE CREAM	24/2.5 OZ	RICH'S	YES	86010	6.96	GILLETTE CREAMERY
10	BAR - POLAR BLAST FRUIT PUNCH	36/2.25 OZ	HERSHEY'S	YES	24682-31000	9.72	HERSHEY'S ICE CREAM
11	BAR - SOUR SWELL CHERRY	24/2.5 OZ	RICH'S	YES	87000	7.92	GILLETTE CREAMERY
12	BAR - STRAWBERRY SCOOTER	36/2.75 OZ	HERSHEY'S	YES	24682-31166	11.16	HERSHEY'S ICE CREAM
13	BAR - TROPI-KOOL FRUIT - BANANA	24/4 OZ	HERSHEY'S	YES	24682-31230	21.12	HERSHEY'S ICE CREAM
14	BAR - TROPI-KOOL FRUIT - MANGO	24/4 OZ	HERSHEY'S	YES	24682-31232	21.12	HERSHEY'S ICE CREAM
15	BAR - TROPI-KOOL FRUIT - STRAWBERRY	24/4 OZ	HERSHEY'S	YES	24682-31234	21.12	HERSHEY'S ICE CREAM
16	BAR - WHOLE FRUIT 100% JUICE - OUTRAGEOUS ORANGE	100/2 OZ	WHOLE FRUIT			NO BID	
17	BAR - WHOLE FRUIT 100% JUICE - OUTRAGEOUS ORANGE	72/3 OZ	WHOLE FRUIT			NO BID	
18	BAR - WHOLE FRUIT 100% JUICE - VERY BERRY	100/2 OZ	WHOLE FRUIT	YES	50210	26.00	GILLETTE CREAMERY
19	BAR - WHOLE FRUIT 100% JUICE - WILD CHERRY	100/2 OZ	WHOLE FRUIT	YES	50205	26.00	GILLETTE CREAMERY
20	BAR - WHOLE FRUIT 100% JUICE - WILD CHERRY	72/3 OZ	WHOLE FRUIT			NO BID	
21	BAR - WHOLE FRUIT 100% JUICE -APPLE	100/2 OZ	WHOLE FRUIT	YES	50215	26.00	GILLETTE CREAMERY
22	BAR - WHOLE FRUIT 100% JUICE -SOUR APPLE-LICIOUS	100/2 OZ	WHOLE FRUIT			NO BID	
23	BAR - WHOLE FRUIT 100% JUICE -SOUR APPLE-LICIOUS	72/3 OZ	WHOLE FRUIT			NO BID	
24	BAR - WHOLE FRUIT 100% JUICE -VERY BERRY	72/3 OZ	WHOLE FRUIT			NO BID	
25	CONE - BIRTHDAY CAKE	24/3 OZ	RICH'S	YES	42400	10.80	GILLETTE CREAMERY
26	CONE - CRAZY	24/4 OZ	HERSHEY'S	YES	24682-31303	12.00	HERSHEY'S ICE CREAM
27	CONE - LOWFAT COOKIES & CREAM	24/4 OZ	GARBER'S	YES	30001	10.80	GILLETTE CREAMERY
28	CONE - VANILLA CHOCOLATE TWIST	24/4 OZ	GARBER'S	YES	30007	9.84	GILLETTE CREAMERY

DUTCHESS BOCES COOPERATIVE ICE CREAM AND FROZEN TREATS BID #1617-08

Contract Period September 22, 2016 through July 31, 2017

AWARD SHEET

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	UNIT OF MEASURE	PREFERRED BRAND	MEETS BUY AMERICAN PROVISION (YES OR NO)	STOCK NO.	TOTAL PRICE PER UNIT OF MEASURE	AWARDED VENDOR
29	CUP - ZERT'S BROWNIE BATTER PUDDING	60/3 OZ	RICH'S			NO BID	
30	CUP - ZERT'S CAKE BATTER PUDDING	60/3 OZ	RICH'S			NO BID	
31	CUP - AMERICAN FLAG 100% FRZ JUICE -BLUE RASP/CHERRY SWIRL	96/4.4 OZ	SHAPE UPS			NO BID	
32	CUP - B'DAY/CELEBRATION 100% FRZ JUICE -BLUE RASP/CHERRY SWIRL	96/4.4 OZ	SHAPE UPS			NO BID	
33	CUP - CAKE BATTER	80/3 OZ	TCBY	YES	282246	48.00	GILLETTE CREAMERY
34	CUP - CHOCOLATE	80/3 OZ	TCBY	YES	282204	48.00	GILLETTE CREAMERY
35	CUP - COOKIES & CREAM	80/3 OZ	TCBY	YES	282207	48.00	GILLETTE CREAMERY
36	CUP - HEART 100% FRZ JUICE -RED CHERRY SWIRL	96/4.4 OZ	SHAPE UPS			NO BID	
37	CUP - ITALIAN ICE- 100% JUICE -BLUE RASPBERRY (TYPHOON)	90/4 OZ	ROSATI	YES	972	34.20	GILLETTE CREAMERY
38	CUP - ITALIAN ICE- 100% JUICE -SEASONAL	90/4 OZ	ROSATI	YES	979	29.70	GILLETTE CREAMERY
39	CUP - ITALIAN ICE- 100% JUICE -SOUR CHERRY (CRYBABY)	90/4 OZ	ROSATI	YES	970	34.20	GILLETTE CREAMERY
40	CUP - LEMON-LIME SHERBET	24/4 OZ	GARBER'S	YES	30301	6.24	GILLETTE CREAMERY
41	CUP - LOWFAT CANDY CANE DESSERT	40/3 OZ	HERSHEY'S	YES	24682-31641	11.20	HERSHEY'S ICE CREAM
42	CUP - LOWFAT CHERRY VANILLA DESSERT	40/3 OZ	HERSHEY'S	YES	24682-31642	11.20	HERSHEY'S ICE CREAM
43	CUP - LOWFAT CHOCOLATE DESSERT	40/3 OZ	GARBER'S	YES	30292	6.96	GILLETTE CREAMERY
44	CUP - LOWFAT CHOCOLATE SUNDAE DESSERT	40/3 OZ	HERSHEY'S	YES	24682-31635	11.20	HERSHEY'S ICE CREAM
45	CUP - LOWFAT COTTON CANDY DESSERT	40/3 OZ	HERSHEY'S	YES	24682-31632	11.20	HERSHEY'S ICE CREAM
46	CUP - LOWFAT MINT CHOCOLATE CHIP DESSERT	40/3 OZ	HERSHEY'S	YES	24682-31643	11.20	HERSHEY'S ICE CREAM
47	CUP - LOWFAT SPOOKY SUNDAE DESSERT	40/3 OZ	HERSHEY'S	YES	24682-31640	11.20	HERSHEY'S ICE CREAM
48	CUP - LOWFAT SPRING PARTY DESSERT	40/3 OZ	HERSHEY'S	YES	24682-31644	11.20	HERSHEY'S ICE CREAM
49	CUP - LOWFAT STRAWBERRY SUNDAE DESSERT	40/3 OZ	HERSHEY'S	YES	24682-31633	11.20	HERSHEY'S ICE CREAM
50	CUP - LOWFAT VANILLA DESSERT	40/3 OZ	GARBER'S	YES	30291	6.96	GILLETTE CREAMERY
51	CUP - NO FAT RASPBERRY YOGURT DESSERT	24/4 OZ	HERSHEY'S	YES	24682-31580	8.16	HERSHEY'S ICE CREAM
52	CUP - NO FAT TWISTER - BIRTHDAY CAKE YOGURT	18/3.75 OZ	HERSHEY'S	YES	24682-50230	9.00	HERSHEY'S ICE CREAM
53	CUP - NO FAT TWISTER - COTTON CANDY YOGURT	18/3.75 OZ	HERSHEY'S	YES	24682-50245	9.00	HERSHEY'S ICE CREAM
54	CUP - NO FAT TWISTER - SOUR APPLE	18/3.75 OZ	HERSHEY'S	YES	24682-50255	9.00	HERSHEY'S ICE CREAM
55	CUP - NO FAT TWISTER - SOUR BLUE RASPBERRY	18/3.75 OZ	HERSHEY'S	YES	24682-50260	9.00	HERSHEY'S ICE CREAM
56	CUP - NO FAT VANILLA YOGURT DESSERT	24/4 OZ	HERSHEY'S	YES	24682-31570	8.16	HERSHEY'S ICE CREAM

DUTCHESS BOCES COOPERATIVE ICE CREAM AND FROZEN TREATS BID #1617-08

Contract Period September 22, 2016 through July 31, 2017

AWARD SHEET

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	UNIT OF MEASURE	PREFERRED BRAND	MEETS BUY AMERICAN PROVISION (YES OR NO)	STOCK NO.	TOTAL PRICE PER UNIT OF MEASURE	AWARDED VENDOR
57	CUP - ORANGE SHERBET	24/4 OZ	GARBER'S	YES	30340	6.24	GILLETTE CREAMERY
58	CUP - PUMPKIN 100% FRZ JUICE -ORANGE/LIME SWIRL	96/4.4 OZ	SHAPE UPS			NO BID	
59	CUP - RASPBERRY SHERBET	24/4 OZ	GARBER'S	YES	30700	6.24	GILLETTE CREAMERY
60	CUP - ROASTY TOASTY MARSHMALLOW	80/3 OZ	TCBY	YES	282282	48.00	GILLETTE CREAMERY
61	CUP - SHAMROCK 100% FRZ JUICE -LEMON/LIME SWIRL	96/4.4 OZ	SHAPE UPS			NO BID	
62	CUP - SHERBET MADE W FRUIT JUICE - LIME	96/4 OZ	LUIGI'S	YES	38442	33.60	GILLETTE CREAMERY
63	CUP - SHERBET MADE W FRUIT JUICE - ORANGE	96/4 OZ	LUIGI'S			NO BID	
64	CUP - SHERBET MADE W FRUIT JUICE - RAINBOW	96/4 OZ	LUIGI'S			NO BID	
65	CUP - SHERBET MADE W FRUIT JUICE - RASPBERRY	96/4 OZ	LUIGI'S	YES	38441	33.60	GILLETTE CREAMERY
66	CUP - SNOWMAN 100% FRZ JUICE -CHERRY/LIME SWIRL	96/4.4 OZ	SHAPE UPS			NO BID	
67	CUP - SPORTS 100% FRZ JUICE -STRAWBERRY/LEMONADE SWIRL	96/4.4 OZ	SHAPE UPS			NO BID	
68	CUP - STRAWBERRY	80/3 OZ	TCBY	YES	282211	48.00	GILLETTE CREAMERY
69	CUP - VANILLA	80/3 OZ	TCBY	YES	282201	48.00	GILLETTE CREAMERY
70	CUP - WHOLE FRUIT 100% JUICE - CHERRY & LEMON SWIRL	96/4.4 OZ	WHOLE FRUIT			NO BID	
71	CUP - WHOLE FRUIT 100% JUICE - MANGO/STRAWBERRY POM SWIRL	96/4.4 OZ	WHOLE FRUIT			NO BID	
72	CUP - WHOLE FRUIT 100% JUICE - MIXED BERRY & LEMON SWIRL	96/4.4 OZ	WHOLE FRUIT			NO BID	
73	CUP - WHOLE FRUIT 100% JUICE - MIXED BERRY & LEMON SWIRL	72/6.6 OZ	WHOLE FRUIT			NO BID	
74	CUP - WHOLE FRUIT 100% JUICE - ORANGE PINEAPPLE	96/4.4 OZ	WHOLE FRUIT			NO BID	
75	CUP - WHOLE FRUIT 100% JUICE - ORANGE PINEAPPLE & CHERRY SWIRL	96/4.4 OZ	WHOLE FRUIT			NO BID	
76	CUP - WHOLE FRUIT 100% JUICE - STRAWBERRY POMEGRANATE	96/4.4 OZ	WHOLE FRUIT			NO BID	
77	CUP - WHOLE FRUIT 100% JUICE - WATERMELON	96/4.4 OZ	WHOLE FRUIT			NO BID	
78	CUP - WHOLE FRUIT 100% JUICE - WILD CHERRY	96/4.4 OZ	WHOLE FRUIT			NO BID	
79	CUP -100% FROZEN JUICE SORBET - BLUE RASPBERRY	96/4.4 OZ	LUIGI'S			NO BID	
80	CUP -100% FROZEN JUICE SORBET - CHERRY/BLUE RASPBERRY SWIRL	96/4.4 OZ	LUIGI'S			NO BID	
81	CUP -100% FROZEN JUICE SORBET - GRAPE	96/4.4 OZ	LUIGI'S			NO BID	
82	CUP -100% FROZEN JUICE SORBET - ORANGE	96/4.4 OZ	LUIGI'S			NO BID	
83	CUP -100% FROZEN JUICE SORBET -KIWI/STRAWBERRY SWIRL	96/4.4 OZ	LUIGI'S			NO BID	
84	CUP -100% FROZEN JUICE SORBET -LIME	96/4.4 OZ	LUIGI'S			NO BID	

DUTCHESS BOCES COOPERATIVE ICE CREAM AND FROZEN TREATS BID #1617-08

Contract Period September 22, 2016 through July 31, 2017

AWARD SHEET

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	UNIT OF MEASURE	PREFERRED BRAND	MEETS BUY AMERICAN PROVISION (YES OR NO)	STOCK NO.	TOTAL PRICE PER UNIT OF MEASURE	AWARDED VENDOR
85	CUP- NO FAT BIRTHDAY CAKE YOGURT DESSERT	40/3 OZ	HERSHEY'S	YES	24682-31630	11.20	HERSHEY'S ICE CREAM
86	PUSH UP - RAINBOW POLE	24/2.75 OZ	RICH'S	YES	42570	10.80	GILLETTE CREAMERY
87	Sandwich - CHOCOLATE Low Fat	24/3.50 OZ	PERRY'S	YES	229	9.36	GILLETTE CREAMERY
88	SANDWICH - MIGHTY MINI ICE CREAM	48/2.5 OZ	HERSHEY'S	YES	24682-31352	13.44	HERSHEY'S ICE CREAM
89	SANDWICH - RF COOKIES 'N CREAM ICE CREAM	24/4 OZ	HERSHEY'S	YES	24682-31355	10.80	HERSHEY'S ICE CREAM
90	SANDWICH - RF VANILLA ICE CREAM	24/4 OZ	HERSHEY'S	YES	24682-31319	10.80	HERSHEY'S ICE CREAM
91	Sandwich - VANILLA Low Fat	24/3.50 OZ	PERRY'S	YES	230	9.36	GILLETTE CREAMERY
92	SANDWICH -RF MINTY MINT	24/4 OZ	HERSHEY'S	YES	24682-31354	10.80	HERSHEY'S ICE CREAM
93	SQUEEZE - SOUR CYCLONE BLUE RASPBERRY	24/3.75 OZ	RICH'S	YES	40140	12.00	GILLETTE CREAMERY
94	STICK BAR - Chocolate Éclair	24/3 OZ	PERRY'S	YES	238	7.92	GILLETTE CREAMERY
95	STICK BAR - Strawberry Éclair	24/3 OZ	PERRY'S	YES	239	7.92	GILLETTE CREAMERY
96	STICK BAR - Strawberry Fruit	24/3 OZ	PERRY'S	YES	252	10.80	GILLETTE CREAMERY
	VENDORS:						
	GILLETTE CREAMERY						GILLETTE CREAMERY
	Attn: Bill Gillette						GILLETTE CREAMERY
	47 Steven's Lane						GILLETTE CREAMERY
	PO Box 256						GILLETTE CREAMERY
	Gardiner, NY 12525						GILLETTE CREAMERY
	Tel: 800-522-2507						GILLETTE CREAMERY
	Fax: 845-419-0922						GILLETTE CREAMERY
	Email: billg@gillettecreamery.com						GILLETTE CREAMERY
	HERSHEY'S ICE CREAM						HERSHEY'S ICE CREAM
	Attn: Timothy J. Ryan						HERSHEY'S ICE CREAM
	29 Dolson Ave.						HERSHEY'S ICE CREAM
	Middletown, NY 10940						HERSHEY'S ICE CREAM
	Tel: 845-343-4129						HERSHEY'S ICE CREAM
	Fax: 845-344-8323						HERSHEY'S ICE CREAM
	Email: ryantim@hersheyicecream.com						HERSHEY'S ICE CREAM